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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 December 2020 5:36 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Claims

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL39R AND SHC5225A ALONT/AT PIE FILTER TO TOA 

PAYOH / KIM KEAT LINK ON 15/10/2020 -- AAD2010-066

Attachments: AAD2010-066 - DV.pdf

Without prejudice 

 

Dear Jaslin 

 

Attach duly signed DV for your action. 

 

Hope to receive your payment soon. 

 

*Due to COVID-19 virus, all correspondence will be by way of email only. Please let me know if you need the original 

signature copy of the documents. 

 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai Yin    

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

* Please be reminded that* Please be reminded that* Please be reminded that* Please be reminded that    all claims correspondence to be send toall claims correspondence to be send toall claims correspondence to be send toall claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct 

of this matter to our of this matter to our of this matter to our of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.solicitors without further reference to you.solicitors without further reference to you.solicitors without further reference to you.    

 

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 

Singapore 569111 

Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764 

 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 8 December, 2020 12:11 PM 

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims 

<claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL39R AND SHC5225A ALONT/AT PIE FILTER TO TOA PAYOH / KIM KEAT LINK ON 

15/10/2020 -- AAD2010-066 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
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Thank you for acceptance. 

  

Please duly sign the Release Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action:  

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 8 December 2020 10:54 AM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims 

<claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL39R AND SHC5225A ALONT/AT PIE FILTER TO TOA PAYOH / KIM KEAT LINK ON 

15/10/2020 -- AAD2010-066 

 

Without prejudice 

 

Dear Jaslin 

 

Please proceed to send us the DV. 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai Yin    

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct 

of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.    

 

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 

Singapore 569111 

Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764 

 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 8 December, 2020 10:47 AM 

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims 

<claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL39R AND SHC5225A ALONT/AT PIE FILTER TO TOA PAYOH / KIM KEAT LINK ON 

15/10/2020 -- AAD2010-066 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Dear Wai Yin 
 
LOI claimed under Body Injury. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 8 December 2020 10:12 AM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims 

<claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL39R AND SHC5225A ALONT/AT PIE FILTER TO TOA PAYOH / KIM KEAT LINK ON 

15/10/2020 -- AAD2010-066 

 

Without prejudice 

 

Dear Jaslin 

 

Noted that our settlement does not consist of LOI, can we check whether the LOI was supposed to be included in the 

settlement? 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai Yin    

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the condu* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the condu* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the condu* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct ct ct ct 

of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.    

 

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 

Singapore 569111 

Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764 

 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 8 December, 2020 9:23 AM 

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims 

<claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL39R AND SHC5225A ALONT/AT PIE FILTER TO TOA PAYOH / KIM KEAT LINK ON 

15/10/2020 -- AAD2010-066 
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Your Ref: SHC 5225A 

LKK Ref: CC3/AIG20011307/Kpa3                                                               Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL 39R AND SHC 5225A ON 15/10/2020 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement as follows: - 

 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3,979.28 

2. Loss of Rental  (7 days x $95.04) 
(w/GST) 

$ 665.28 

3. LTA Search Fee $ 7.49      

Total $ 4,652.05 

Please confirm acceptance. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 4 December 2020 2:26 PM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims 

<claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL39R AND SHC5225A ALONT/AT PIE FILTER TO TOA PAYOH / KIM KEAT LINK ON 

15/10/2020 -- AAD2010-066 

 

Without prejudice 

 

Dear Jaslin 

 

Attached is our LOD for your action. 

 

Please advise your offering soon so that we can expedite and process the claims. 

 

*Due to COVID-19 virus, all correspondence will be by way of email only. Please let me know if you need the original 

signature copy of the documents. 

 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 
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Ng Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai Yin    

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

* Please be reminded that* Please be reminded that* Please be reminded that* Please be reminded that    all claims correspondence to be send toall claims correspondence to be send toall claims correspondence to be send toall claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct 

of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.    

 

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 

Singapore 569111 

Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764 

 

 

From: Wai Yin Ng [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 5 November, 2020 9:12 AM 

To: 'Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)' <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL39R AND SHC5225A ALONT/AT PIE FILTER TO TOA PAYOH / KIM KEAT LINK ON 

15/10/2020 -- AAD2010-066 

 

Without prejudice 

 

Dear all 

 

Enclose is video footage for your investigation. 

 

From the video you can see, our taxi was travelling straight on his lane, your client suddenly swerved lane from the right 

without any signal and causing this accident. 

 

Please advise your offering soon so that we can expedite and process the claims. 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai Yin    

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct 

of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.    

 

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 

Singapore 569111 

Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764 

 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 4 November, 2020 10:11 AM 

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCL39R AND SHC5225A ALONT/AT PIE FILTER TO TOA PAYOH / KIM KEAT LINK ON 

15/10/2020 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 
  

We refer to the above matter. 
  

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 

 
 

Please provide us a copy of accident video as stated in your client accident report for our viewing. 

 
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong. 
  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.  

 

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


