Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 November 2020 5:29 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: FINALISE - SMH8475P (MIT) / OD AIG / DOA: 17/10/2020
Attachments: final & supp.pdf

Hi Shirley,

Follow this marking . Supplementary repair front Rh chassis and spray Rh chassis no need to include, cancel, already
inform Don.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 5 November 2020 5:02 PM

To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)'

Subject: RE: FINALISE - SMH8475P (MIT) / OD AIG / DOA: 17/10/2020

Hi Shirley,
Attached marking and supp, need take mandate from AIG, photos uploaded in Merimen.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Jojo Cheng [mailto:jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 2 November 2020 6:03 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos; Loi Ai Ting; Coco Lu Ting; Don Bong Kiong Hua
Subject: FINALISE - SMH8475P (MIT) / OD AIG / DOA: 17/10/2020

Hi Taufikh,

Attached file for your kind reference.

Kindly confirm finalize amount at $ 13,687.39 after GST.
Best Regards,

JoJo Cheng
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DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the
views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



