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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: LOD For Our Insured Veh SJX2191Z *** CC4/LPC20011284/Kba3

Dear Sir/Madam 
  
RE: ACCIDENT ON 15/10/2020 @ 14:50HRS 
ALONG X JUNC OF MARYMOUNT ROAD AND LANE 
INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SJX2191Z & GBB5752X 
  
  
We understand that you are the insurer of   GBB5752X vehicle. 
  
I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle SJX2191Z have been completed repairs to my/our satisfaction 
by M/s NGS AUTOMOTIVE.  I/We therefore propose to claim from you as follow:- 
  

1.      Cost of Repair                                                S$ 2200.00    

2.      LTA Search                                                    S$       7.45 

3.      Loss Of Use– 4days@$60.00                        S$   240.00 (Include Survey) 

TOTAL                             S$ 2447.45   

  
A copy each of the following supporting documents is attached:- 
  

a)      Authorise to Act  
b)      Our bill M/s NGS Automotive 
c)      Cert of insurance 
d)      SJX2191Z SAS Report 
e)      GBB5752X LTA Search fee 
f)       Driver Contract 

  
  

Please let us have your reply soonest possible. 

Thank you. 

  

Yours faithfully, 

NGS AUTOMOTIVE 
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A 
#02-01 AMK AutPoint 
Singapore 568047 
Evelyn Ng HP 9695 5547 
 
 

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 







NGSAUTOMOTIVE
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind. Pk 2a #02-01 AMK AutoPoint Singapore 568047

Tel: 64815727 Fax: 64815772 Email: evelyn1911ngsautomotive@gmail.com
Reg No.:53405718K

SJX2191Z KIA CERATO 

S$

6296 27066279 9256 :: FAXTEL 

MOTOR CLAIM DEPT

:

:

:

AmountDescription

18/11/2020Date

Veh No

SINGAPORE 199555

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE

300 BEACH ROAD

INVOICE
No. AINV2011-010

1 of 1Page :

:Mileage

:Your Ref

AQT-0025/SJX2191Z:Our Ref

ACC ON 15/10/2020 INVOLVING VEH SJX2191Z & 
GBB5752X

ALONG X JUNC OF MARYMOUNT ROAD AND LANE

LUMP SUM REPAIR 2,200.00

SURVEY BY : MR KENNETH

SINGAPORE DOLLAR TWO THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED ONLY 2,200.00Net Total
Notes :
1. All cheques should be crossed and made payable to 

2. Goods sold are neither returnable nor refundable.

NGS AUTOMOTIVE

Authorised Signature



Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 17 Oct 2020 / 13:04:27

Receipt Date/Time : 17 Oct 2020 / 13:04:26

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-201017-001051

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - GBB5752X
As at 15 Oct 2020/14:50:00
Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

1 Insurance Enquiry - GBB5752X
Enquiry Fee 
20201017130234669910

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

426588XXXXXX1986 eNETS Credit Card 7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 April 2021 3:53 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBB5752X (OI)  & SJX2191Z (TP) 

along Marymount Road on 15/10/2020 - Oref: 19/20/20/VC05/023783 [External 
Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Jasper  
 
Please proceed as per your recommendations.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 22 March 2021 10:14 am 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBB5752X (OI) & SJX2191Z (TP) along 
Marymount Road on 15/10/2020 - Oref: 19/20/20/VC05/023783 [External Confidential] 
 
Dear Kenny, 
 
We refer to the subject matter. 
 
It was reported that Insured driver turning. (BOLA 5) 
 
Summary to offer to repairer NGS AUTOMOTIVE   is as follows: 
 

TP CLAIMED REVISED -TO 
OFFER  
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Cost of Repair   $         4,090.69   $           2,200.00  

Loss of Use (4 days x $60.00) $            240.00   $              240.00  
LTA Search   $                7.45   $                  7.45  
Proposed Total   $         4,338.14   $           2,447.45  

 
Breakdown of days is as follows: 
 

Recommended repair days  3 
Weekends / Downtime  1 
CLAIM DAYS  4 

 
For your approval and/or further instruction please. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE  
Sent: Monday, 9 November 2020 12:58 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  
Cc: MT_Claim_SG ; Admin A ; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)  
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBB5752X (OI) & SJX2191Z (TP) along 
Marymount Road on 15/10/2020 - Oref: 19/20/20/VC05/023783 [External Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Mei Kwan  
 
Please see attachment for a copy of our Insured’s GIA report.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or 
corrupt practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 9 November 2020 12:22 pm 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK 
Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBB5752X (OI) & SJX2191Z (TP) along 
Marymount Road on 15/10/2020 - Oref: 19/20/20/VC05/023783 [External Confidential] 
 
LPC REF: 19/20/20/VC05/023783 
LKK REF: CC4/LPC20011284/Kba3 
 
Dear Kenny, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 21 October, 2020 4:51 PM 
To: 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE' <kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK 
Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBB5752X (OI) & SJX2191Z (TP) along 
Marymount Road on 15/10/2020 - Oref: 19/20/20/VC05/023783 [External Confidential] 
 
LPC REF: 19/20/20/VC05/023783 
LKK REF: CC4/LPC20011284/Kba3 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We had inspected TP vehicle SJX 2191Z on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement. 
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