Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 7 January 2021 10:00 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBR 751Y TP AIG DOA 9/10/2020

Hi Sir

We accept amount $2800/- (bf GST) and 04 working days
Thanks & Regards

Ms Phang

Yee Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722
ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com
Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459

[x] = Virus-free. WWW.avg.com

On Tue, 5 Jan 2021 at 15:12, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/madam,

Please check and revert

Offer at lump sum $2800, 4days

Best Regards,



Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



