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SFT1121B claiming against SFA8282Z
From: Chin, Lee-Ying
To: 'assignments', 'Admin A'
Cc: Lim, Kok-Chong
Sent: 10/14/2020 4:21:22 PM
Attachments: SFT1121B document.pdf MRM54594273.pdf

Hi LKK, 

Kindly assist to handle. 

Thanks. 

Best Regards 
Lee Ying, Chin 
AIG 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1947 
Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com | www.aig.sg  

-----Original Message----- 
From: mandy.neo@edgevantage.com <mandy.neo@edgevantage.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 14, 2020 4:11 PM 
To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] SFT1121B claiming against SFA8282Z 

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Hi, 

Attached for TP claim 
please advise if direct settlement is possible. 

Please arrange surveyor on the 16 Oct 2020 ( fri) 10am-12pm owner waiting 

Best regards, 
Mandy Neo. 
Motor Edgevantage Pte Ltd 
160 sin ming # 03-01/02 
sin ming autocity Singapore 575722 

Mobile 87783280 
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The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you ha


