Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: perlin <banchoon@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 October 2020 12:54 PM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMT 419 S - Finalization

Hi Taufikh

We accept your offer for the COR by lump @ $3,100.00 (before GST) and
3 days for repairs.

Thanks & Regards.

Perlin

On 27/10/2020 12:21 PM, Taufikh (LKK Auto) wrote:
> Hi Perlin,

>

> Refer attached, COR I/s $3100, 3 days.

>

> Regards

> Taufikh

> Lkk Auto

>

> From: perlin [mailto:banchoon@singnet.com.sg]
> Sent: Monday, 19 October 2020 3:48 PM

> To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

> Subject: SMT 419 S - Finalization

>

> Hi Taufikh

>

> Attached herewith are vehicle no. SMT 419 S revised quotation
>

> and after spray paint photos for your finalization.
>

> Thanks & Regards.

>

> Perlin

>

>

>



