Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 May 2021 11:07 AM
To: Thiam Heng Huat

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Estimate/GIA for SMD4105E

Dear Steven,

Noted with thanks.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 May 2021 10:03 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Estimate/GIA for SMD4105E

Dear Celine,

We confirm COR at lump sum $3,900 (before GST) and 06 repair days.
Warmest regards,

Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295

On Tuesday, 11 May 2021, 02:41:38 pm SGT, Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong @Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Steven,

Please revert on confirmation.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 April 2021 5:26 PM

To: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176 @yahoo.com>

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong @ Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Estimate/GIA for SMD4105E

Dear Steven,

| have received the marked estimate from Kenneth. Based on our computation the offer is as below.

Parts After 20% - $3,136.56
Special Nett -$ 325.00
Labour - $1,460.00

Sub Total ( Parts + S/N + Labour)- $4,921.56

Lump Sum - 20% - $3,900.00 and 06 Repair Days

Please confirm.



Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176 @yahoo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 12:22 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong @ Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Estimate/GIA for SMD4105E

Dear Kenneth,

Kindly advise the final repair costs and repair days for this vehicle.

Warmest regards,

Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd

82636295

On Wednesday, 14 October 2020, 10:50:17 am SGT, Thiam Heng Huat <thh176 @yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Kenneth,

Please see attachments.



Warmest regards,
Steven
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd

82636295



