
5/18/2021 Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQkAGY5MjA5NjAxLWUzOTktNDAzMi1hNmYyLWQzMjg1MjhjYjA2OQAQANTYf7Tmk%2B9Lj3mfmBDZ… 1/1

Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGG 6235E & SGX 6309L ALONG/AT EXIT TO SPC PETROL
STATION TURNING INTO ADAM ROAD ON 02/10/2020

vikram khanna <vkhanna@rocketmail.com>
Tue 5/18/2021 11:14 AM

To:  Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

3 attachments (5 MB)

accident_report_mine.jpg; car1.jpg; car2.jpg;

Hi Jaslin
As I mentioned, my vehicle was not damaged at all, because only my tire rubbed against the side of the other car (SGX6309L). So there was no
need to take a photo of my own car. 
But I did take a photo of the other car.
I did not report the accident to the police because a) There was no damage to any public property b) Nobody was hurt. It was a minor accident that
any insurance company should be able to handle on a routine basis. 

I attach the photo I took of the damage to the other car.
I also attach my account of the accident.
The other car only provided the camera footage of the moment of the accident which shows my tire rubbing against that car. But it is critical to obtain
the footage from the other car for the one minute BEFORE the accident took place.
It will clearly show that the other car came from behind and tried to overtake me when I was turning into a one-lane road. The driver thought it was
two lane. That is the first thing he said to me when he came out. There was nothing wrong with him - no injury whatsoever. His medical claims are
all invented - I think he views this as an opportunity to make money. I believe AIG requested camera footage from the other car for the minute
BEFORE the accident, but the other car declined to provide that footage - surely because the driver knows it would show that he was in the wrong.

I tried to get the footage from the petrol station camera, but they said they can only release this if requested by the police. I don't even know if they
have it now because they keep it for about 6 months
I hope you can resolve this without submitting to the other driver's ridiculous claim.

best regards
Vikram

On Tuesday, May 18, 2021, 10:50:21 AM GMT+8, Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear	Sir

We	refer	to	our	tele	conversation	earlier	on,

Kindly	let	us	have	your	vehicle	damages	photos

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
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