Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 October 2020 1:45 PM

To: Kuru & Co

Cc: CHINA TP Motor Claims

Subject: RE: MUTUAL CLIENT - SMF 5992T - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 5992T / SHC

6231A / OTHERS ON 08/10/2020 // Our ref: L.20.0820.It(jt)

Dear Lena,

Please be informed that this is a chain collision case and we will settle with the front vehicle on a “Without Prejudice”
basis.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kuru & Co [mailto:kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 19 October 2020 5:11 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: CHINA TP Motor Claims

Subject: MUTUAL CLIENT - SMF 5992T - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 5992T / SHC 6231A / OTHERS ON 08/10/2020 //
Our ref: L.20.0820.lt(jt)

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 5992T, GBB 7124X AND SHC 6231A ON 08.10.2020
ALONG BRADDELL ROAD

INJURED DRIVER: TEOH WONG HAR

Refer to the forwarded email below.

We act for our mutual client, Mr Teoh Wong Har, driver of motor vehicle registration number SMF 5992T
who was injured in the above accident.



Our client has instructed us to claim for his property damages, personal injury and other consequential loss in
the above matter.

As we are instructed to proceed further for our client’s claim, as such, please do not prejudice our client’s
rights and interest pertaining to the above matter.

We shall keep you informed of any material developments and trust you to do the same.

Regards,

Lena

Kuru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-06 Fook Hai Building
Singapore 058727

Tel: 6532 2009

Fax: 6532 2007

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential
information and/or may be subjected to legal privilege. If you have received in error, please notify us immediately by return
email, delete this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JialLe@lkkauto.com>

Date: Mon, 19 Oct 2020, 09:33

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 5992T / SHC 6231A / OTHERS ON 08/10/2020

To: wonghar87@gmail.com <wonghar87@gmail.com>

Our Ref: CC3/CTI120011025/Eda3

TEOH WONG HAR

BLK 651A JURONG WEST ST 61

#03-372

SINGAPORE 641651

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 5992T / SHC 6231A / OTHERS ON 08/10/2020



We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given us your version
of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us within 10 days
from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



