Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 April 2021 9:34 AM

To: PBSP

Subject: RE: LOD Y/ref: CC3/AIG20010983/R1ps3qg2 O/ref: DS/2344154/SDV50S
Attachments: DV_SDV50S.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We confirm settlement as per your LOD: -

Cost of Repair $6,619.77 Excess t §-
Loss of Use @ % 400,00 ($100%4 days) GIALTA Search : $200
Loss of Rental: § - Others %
Total : $7,021.77

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 19 March 2021 8:33 AM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LOD Y/ref: CC3/AIG20010983/R1ps3q2 O/ref: DS/2344154/SDV50S
Without Prejudice

Hi Evelyn,

We are still pending for mandate from AIG.



We will follow up and get back to you.

Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 March 2021 9:07 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD Y/ref: CC3/A1G20010983/R1ps3q2 O/ref: DS/2344154/SDV50S

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Any update?

Regards,
Evelyn
DID: 6319 0175 Fax: 6479 4601

c/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 March 2021 1:59 PM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LOD Y/ref: CC3/A1G20010983/R1ps3q2 O/ref: DS/2344154/SDV50S

[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments
and links.

Without Prejudice



Hi Evelyn,
We are currently pending for mandate from AIG.
We will expedite the matter and get back to you.

Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 March 2021 11:53 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: LOD Y/ref: CC3/AIG20010583/ps3 O/ref: DS/2344154/SDV50S

Hi Hsiao Tong,
We refer to our LOD of 15.02.21.

Please let us have offer soon.

Regards,
Evelyn
DID: 6319 0175 Fax: 6479 4601

c/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 February 2021 3:08 PM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD Y/ref: CC3/AIG20010583/ps3 O/ref: DS/2344154/SDV50S

3




[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments
and links.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Evelyn,

Kindly note that the respective case handler will look into this matter.
Dear Hsiao Tong,

FYNA.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy.
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

57474

ReERER W Saye the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 February 2021 12:38 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD Y/ref: CC3/AIG20010583/ps3 O/ref: DS/2344154/SDV50S

Hi

We refer to the above.
Attached herewith copy of our LOD dated 15.02.21 and all it supporting documents for your perusal.
Please let us have your offer soon.

Originals are in the mail.

Regards,



Evelyn

c/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0175 Fax: 6479 4601



