Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 June 2021 4:46 pm

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SLV 9367A - STELLA TOH XUE ER | DOA : 30/09/2020 | REF. NO. :

SNM20D203767/SLC1596H/TANKL

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <claims@chengauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 25 June 2021 4:46:08 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLV 9367A - STELLA TOH XUE ER | DOA : 30/09/2020 | REF. NO.

Dear Mr Taufikh,
Thank you for making an offer.
We accept Lumpsum $3250 before GST, 06 repair days.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Claims Department

Muvugesan
CHENG AUTO:

B ody wor ks

CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 June 2021 12:46 PM

To: 'CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM' <claims@chengauto.com>
Cc: 'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)' <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

: SNM20D203767/SLC1596H/TANKL

Subject: RE: SLV 9367A - STELLA TOH XUE ER | DOA : 30/09/2020 | REF. NO. : SNM20D203767/SLC1596H/TANKL

Hi,
Please refer attached, COR 1/s$3250, 6 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM [mailto:claims@chengauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 16 December 2020 10:54 AM
To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'

Subject: RE: SLV 9367A - STELLA TOH XUE ER | DOA : 30/09/2020 | REF. NO.

Dear Mr Taufikh,

Please let us have your offer.

: SNM20D203767/SLC1596H/TANKL



Thanks & Best Regards,
Claims Department

Muvugesan
CHENG AUTO:

B ody wor ks

CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <claims@chengauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 November 2020 5:27 PM

To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)' <taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLV 9367A - STELLA TOH XUE ER | DOA : 30/09/2020 | REF. NO

Dear Mr Taufikh,
Attached is our finalisation report.
Please let us have your offer.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Claims Department

Murugesan
CHENG AUTO:

B ody wor ks

CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM>

Sent: Saturday, 17 October 2020 12:14 PM

To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)' <taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLV 9367A - STELLA TOH XUE ER | DOA : 30/09/2020 | REF. NO

Dear Mr Taufikh,
Attached herewith the after repair photos.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Claims Department

Rackeld Las
CHENG AUTO

B ody wor ks

CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM>
Sent: Tuesday, 13 October 2020 3:46 pm
To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)' <taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

. :SNM20D203767/SLC1596H/TANKL

.2 SNM20D203767/SLC1596H/TANKL

Subject: SLV 9367A - STELLA TOH XUE ER | DOA : 30/09/2020 | REF. NO. : SNM20D203767/SLC1596H/TANKL

Dear Mr Taufikh,



Attached herewith the checked item photos for your reference.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Claims Department

Eachel Las
CHENG AUTO

B ody wor ks

CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431

Reporting Centre
Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-60 Pioneer Point, Singapore 627607
Email: claims@chengauto.com

Workshop
Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-62 Pioneer Point, Singapore 627607
Email: cab@chengauto.com

Spraypainting
Address: 1 Soon Lee Street #06-41 Pioneer Centre, Singapore 627605
Email: cab@chengauto.com




