Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 October 2020 10:39 pm
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: SIN 8545 - Finalize

Attachments: SIN 8545.pdf

Dear Shirley,

Finalize already.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Yong Patric Yong [mailto:yihengmotorworkshop@yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, October 22, 2020 10:09 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SIN 8545 - Finalize

Dear Steve
We agree to finalize on lump sum $2900.00 and 4 working repair days.
Thank you.

Regards,
Wan Ping

On Thursday, 22 October 2020, 09:20:37 am SGT, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <stevechen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Kindly refer our finalize $2900 (L/S, before GST). 4 days.

Kindly confirm.



Thanks

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



