Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 January 2021 12:50 PM

To: STK STK

Subject: RE: SKV2225) Against GBH3464J) DOA :07/10/2020
Attachments: DV_SKV2225).pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for acceptance.

As spoken our offer of global sum at $15,000.00(included repair cost, Loss of use & LTA search fee) .

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following document to us(LKK) for our necessary
action: -

e Repair Tax Invoice ($12,800.00+ 7%GST=$13,696.00)
e Authorisation to Act( Pls chop & sign on the right side on ATA)

Date this __* dayof _°7 __ (month)2020 _(year)

K

Signed by “the third party claimant”

Signad by "the warkshop”

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 January 2021 11:34 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SKV2225J Against GBH3464J DOA :07/10/2020
Dear Hsiao

We accepted the cost of repair $ 15000.00.

Thank you

Yours sincerely
Tan Guohua

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> 20211 H22HE A F411:035i&:

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)



Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $15,000.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 January 2021 3:28 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SKV2225J Against GBH3464J) DOA :07/10/2020

Dear Hsiao Tong



Please advise the offer as soon as possible.

Thank you

Yours sincerely
Tan Guohua

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 2020512 529H &~ 410:0851i&

Without Prejudice

Hi,

We are pending for mandate approval from our principal.

We will follow up and get back to you. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 8:56 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SKV2225J Against GBH3464) DOA :07/10/2020

Dear Hsiao Tong

Please procced the payment as soon as possible.

Thank you

Yours sincerely

Tan Guohua



STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER

STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com> F2020%F 12521 H E— T 4-4:285i&:

Dear Hsiao Tong

Please find the attached document for your further action.

Thank you

Yours sincerely
Tan Guohua

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER




STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com> F2020F 12 H14HF— F49:25514:

Dear Hsiao Tong

Please follow up the offer as soon as possible.

Thank you

Yours sincerely

Tan Guohua

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg
Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER

Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 202012 58HE — T4-2:095 34

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Mr. Tan,

We are preparing our report to seek mandate and will expedite.

Please be informed that this matter is currently handled by my colleague, Hsiao Tong.
7



Thank you.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com>

Sent: 8 December 2020 1:32 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SKV2225J Against GBH3464) DOA :07/10/2020

Dear Khan

Please send me the offer as soon as possible.

Thank you

Yours sincerely
Tan Guohua

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669
8



8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER




