Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 January 2021 3:57 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: TP Claim GBJ2568P & GBF3558H (QBE) *** LKK REF: CC6/QBE20010774/da3
Attachments: SCAN_20210113_155219114.pdf

Dear Jaslin

Please find the duly signed DV for your attention.

Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 12, 2021 9:52 AM

To: Chin

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: TP Claim GBJ2568P & GBF3558H (QBE) *** LKK REF: CC6/QBE20010774/da3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for acceptance.

Please duly sign the Discharge Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 January 2021 9:37 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP Claim GBJ2568P & GBF3558H (QBE) *** LKK REF: CC6/QBE20010774/da3

Dear Jaslin



We accept your offer amount of $8127.40 in settlement of this claims and please forward us your DV.

Thank you

Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, January 11, 2021 5:14 PM

To: Chin

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: TP Claim GBJ2568P & GBF3558H (QBE) *** LKK REF: CC6/QBE20010774/da3

Your Ref: GBJ 2568P

LKK Ref: CC6/QBE20010774/Ara3q2 Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 3558H AND GBJ 2568P ON 06/10/2020

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 7,625.84

2. Loss of Use (5 days x $100.00) $ 500.00

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 2.00
Total | $8,127.84

Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 9 October 2020 10:11 AM
To: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>




Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP Claim GBJ2568P & GBF3558H (QBE) *** LKK REF: CC6/QBE20010774/da3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Grace,

We have just received ourinsured’s accident report and will revert the liability as soon as possible.
Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chin [mailto:chin@modernautomotive.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 9 October 2020 10:02 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: TP Claim GBJ2568P & GBF3558H (QBE) *** LKK REF: CC6/QBE20010774/da3

Dear Jia Le
Please revert to our email yesterday.

Thank you

Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Chin [mailto:chin@modernautomotive.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, October 8, 2020 9:24 AM

To: 'Jia Le (LKK Auto)' <JiaLe@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP Claim GBJ2568P & GBF3558H (QBE) *** LKK REF: CC6/QBE20010774/da3

Dear Jia Le
Please advise whether your insured has reported and let us have the liability asap.

Thank you



Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, October 6, 2020 7:35 PM

To: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP Claim GBJ2568P & GBF3558H (QBE) *** LKK REF: CC6/QBE20010774/da3

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

We are currently pending for our principal to release OI GIA report.

Please arrange for survey.
Our respective case handler, Jia Le will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 October, 2020 4:08 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: TP Claim GBJ2568P & GBF3558H (QBE)

Dear Sir

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise liability and arrange survey our client vehicle as follow:
Your Insured: GBF3558H

Our Insured: GBJ2568P
DOA: 06.10.2020



We enclosed herewith our client’s report and video footage for your perusal and please revert.

Thank you.

Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720



