Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Sebastian <tklee0247@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 11:50 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Acc Inlv PC8721U & SJH2897E on 29/09/2020
Dear Jia Le,

We do not have Scene video footage.
Please review and get back to us asap.
Thank you

Best Regards,
Sebastian

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November, 2020 11:40 AM

To: Sebastian

Subject: RE: Acc Inlv PC8721U & SJH2897E on 29/09/2020

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sebastian,
Kindly let us have a copy of video footage for our viewing.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sebastian [mailto:tklee0247@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 11:18 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Acc Inlv PC8721U & SJH2897E on 29/09/2020

Dear Jia Le,

The following file attachment is LOD for PC8721U for your settlement.

Do have your reply soon to settle the case.



Thanks & Best Regards

Sebastian

T K Lee Automotive Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#02-47 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6509 5521

Fax: 6509 5523



