Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 January 2022 9:49 AM

To: '‘Boo seng yak'’; Carrine Leong; (nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg);
claims@premiumauto.com.sg; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: AIG-OD SMR 296P (O/S PORTION) DOA: 02/10/2020

Dear Mr Boo,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $24,306.92 before excess $3,500.00 & GST with 12 days of repair,
subject to their approval.
(Labour no. 7 at $5,000 and Labour no. 8 at $3,825).

Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us for close case.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 January 2022 2:34 PM

To: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>;
(nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg) <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>; claims@premiumauto.com.sg;
jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: AIG-OD SMR 296P (O/S PORTION) DOA: 02/10/2020

Dear Sir/Madam,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $23,806.92 with 12 days of repair, subject to their approval.
(Labour no. 7 at $4,500 (9 days) and Labour no. 8 at $3,825 (6.5 panels + $250).

Kindly check.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



