Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Serene LIM <serene@autocare.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 30 October 2020 4:34 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL] ACC INVLG GBJ4198K & SCF8811G ALONG EUNOS AVENUE 6 ON
28.09.2020 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM20010567/Kba3

Attachments: Rental Agreement+Inv 5d @$650.pdf; LOA.pdf; Final Bill $3434.55.pdf

Hi Jasper

Kindly revert. Thank you

Serene LIM

Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co

Tel: +65 64545011 | Fax: +65 64593724 | Hp: +65 96852332
E-mail: serene@autocare.com.sg

From: Serene LIM [mailto:serene@autocare.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 23 October 2020 12:41 pm

To: 'Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)'; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Admin A'

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] ACC INVLG GBJ4198K & SCF8811G ALONG EUNOS AVENUE 6 ON 28.09.2020 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM20010567/Kba3

Hi Jasper

We are quantifying below
RC $3434.55

LOR $$130 x5d $650

Total : $4084.55

Attached supporting documents
Pls revert, Thank you

Serene LIM

Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co

Tel: +65 64545011 | Fax: +65 64593724 | Hp: +65 96852332
E-mail: serene@autocare.com.sg

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 5 October 2020 4:46 pm

To: Serene LIM; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] ACC INVLG GBJ4198K & SCF8811G ALONG EUNOS AVENUE 6 ON 28.09.2020 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM20010567/Kba3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



