
1

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 3 March 2021 4:25 PM
To: Kazali Haji Selahudin
Subject: RE: Your Ref: T 1030/ SHD3495U/ KS(st)  // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG20010545/Epa3 

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJA5748U(AIG) AND SHD3495U ON 01/10/2020]
Attachments: Private Settlement(SHD3495U vs SJA5748U).pdf; Cheque Copy(from OI).pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Kazali, 
 
Attached is a copy of private settlement form and cheque for your reference. 
 
We will send out the cheque to you by dispatch. 
 
Kindly assist to sign on the private settlement form and return to us(LKK) via email. Thanks. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 2 March 2021 3:37 PM 
To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg> 
Subject: Your Ref: T 1030/ SHD3495U/ KS(st) // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG20010545/Epa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
SJA5748U(AIG) AND SHD3495U ON 01/10/2020] 
 
Your Ref: T 1030/ SHD3495U/ KS(st)                                       Without Prejudice 
LKK Ref: CC4/AIG20010545/Epa3 
  
Hi Kazali, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJA5748U(AIG) AND SHD3495U ON 01/10/2020 
  
We refer to the above matter. 



2

 
As spoken earlier, we have spoken to our insured and he agreed to settle the matter at g/s $1,700.00(all-in). 
 
We will follow up with our insured on the payment and get back to you. 
 
Thanks. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 


