Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 7:25 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: AccReport; Admin A

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHD1137S [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHA4859M AND SHD1137S
ON 29/09/2020]

Attachments: 15122020185914-0001.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Jaslin,
Hereby attached signed Discharge Voucher and Letter of Authority.
We will provide you with the tax invoice soonest.

Kindly let us have your settlement payment of global sum (all-in) $2,500.00/- (5 days) in favour of Premier Automotive
Services Pte Ltd soonest possible.

Please be informed that this settlement excludes any bodily injuries arising out of the above said accident and pertains
to property damages only.

Thank you.

Regards

Vincent Chua
Operations Officer & Claims Settlement Assistant
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 075 | DID: 6544 6689 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.sg

NOTE: Please be informed that we have changed our email from Vincent.chua@premiertaxi.com to Vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact the
sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

&4 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION g&

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 4:30 pm

To: Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg>

Cc: AccReport <AccReport@premierauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHD1137S [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHA4859M AND SHD1137S ON 29/09/2020]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for acceptance.

Please duly sign the Discharge Receipt enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 3:35 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: AccReport <AccReport@premierauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHD1137S [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHA4859M AND SHD1137S ON 29/09/2020]

Without Prejudice

Dear Jaslin,

On a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability whatsoever on our client’s part and driver of SHD1137S,
our client is agreeable on your offer of global sum (all-in) $2,500.00/- (5 days) for the settlement on the above claim.

Kindly let us have your discharge voucher of global sum (all-in) $2,500.00/- (5 days) in favour of Premier Automotive
Services Pte Ltd soonest possible.

Please be informed that this settlement excludes any bodily injuries arising out of the above said accident and pertains
to property damages only.

Thank you.

Regards

Vincent Chua
Operations Officer & Claims Settlement Assistant
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 075 | DID: 6544 6689 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.sg

NOTE: Please be informed that we have changed our email from Vincent.chua@premiertaxi.com to Vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact the
sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

&2 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION g&
2



From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 14 December 2020 5:27 pm

To: Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg>

Cc: AccReport <AccReport@premierauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHD1137S [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHA4859M AND SHD1137S ON 29/09/2020]

Your Ref: SHD 1137S

LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20010505/T1rs3q2 Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 4859M AND SHD 1137S ON 29/09/2020

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $2,500.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 November 2020 7:44 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>

Cc: AccReport <AccReport@premierauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHD1137S [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHA4859M AND SHD1137S ON 29/09/2020]

Without Prejudice

Dear Jia Le,
Hereby attached LOD for your necessary action.

Please refer to the screenshot below.



1 second prior to the impact, my Client’s vehicle can be observed, travelling straight within his own lane. The IU
unit within the vehicle is aligned with the arrow signage in the middle of the lane.

Hence, this is not a case of side swipe between both vehicles. The only remaining logical outcome that
remains here is your insured failing to keep within the boundaries of his own lane, encroaching and hitting
onto my Client’s rear right portion.

Scene video has already been provided for review. Please let us have your offer at 100% soonest, in view of clear
liability.

Thank you.

Regards

Vincent Chua
Operations Officer & Claims Settlement Assistant
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 075 | DID: 6544 6689 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.sg

NOTE: Please be informed that we have changed our email from Vincent.chua@premiertaxi.com to Vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact the
sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

&3 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE
POLLUTION g&



From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 26 October 2020 5:23 pm

To: Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg>

Cc: AccReport <AccReport@premierauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHD1137S [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHA4859M AND SHD1137S ON 29/09/2020]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Vincent,
Based on video footage, we propose 50/50 liability as both parties side swipe each other.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is
much regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vincent Chua [mailto:vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 October 2020 9:19 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: AccReport; Admin A

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHD1137S [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHA4859M AND SHD1137S ON 29/09/2020]

Without Prejudice

Dear Jia Le,

Hereby attached accident footage.

Your insured travelling along in the right lane, encroached onto my Client's lane, resulting in the collision.
We will provide the LOD and supporting documents to you soon.

Thank you.

Regards

Vincent Chua

Operations Officer & Claims Settlement Assistant

Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
5



Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 075 | DID: 6544 6689 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.sg

NOTE: Please be informed that we have changed our email from Vincent.chua@premiertaxi.com to Vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact the
sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

&3 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE
POLLUTION g&

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 October 2020 9:11 am

To: Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg>; Shafawati <shafawati.rabu@premierauto.com.sg>
Subject: Your ref: SHD1137S [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHA4859M AND SHD1137S ON 29/09/2020]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Kindly let us have a copy of video footage for our viewing.
Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is
much regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



