- RE: - SMU4060K / 8443247015SG - Request for police report

From: Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur

To: sur@lkkauto.com, claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang, Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts
Sent:  10/1/2020 10:04:04 AM



Dear Denise,

Coverage has been confirmed.

OD excess $1,200. 50% in car camera excess waiver applied $600.

YIDR excess applied $3000 as driver has less than 2 years driving experience.
Hence, final excess is $3600.

Thanks and regards,

Aashweenjeet Kaur (Aashween)

AlIG

Claims Adjuster Il

Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

Tel 8001206556 | Ext: 1002215
Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: sur@lkkauto.com <sur@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 1, 2020 9:22 AM

To: Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur <Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com>; claims@premiumaut
Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts
<NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>

Subject: RE: - SMU4060K / 8443247015SG - Request for police report

Dear Aashween,

Police report uploaded in merimen

Regards,

Denise

From: Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur

Sent: Wed, 30 Sep 2020 07:05:22 +0000

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Cc: SUR, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts
Subject: - SMU4060K / 8443247015SG - Request for police report

Dear Sir,

Kindly assist to request driver to provide police report as 3rd party reported injured and received medic

P R S
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Claims Adjuster Il

Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

Tel 8001206556 | Ext: 1002215
Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com | www.aig.sg
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