Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear Jaslin,

We only have scene photos.

Nicole Chong <nicole@casgarage.sg>

Tuesday, 29 September 2020 2:16 PM

Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 7011B AND SHA 351L ALONG ALEXANDRA RD
(GANGES AVE) ON 26.09.2020 *** LKK REF : CC4/FCI20010411/Ada3
PHOTO-2020-09-26-19-48-03.jpg; PHOTO-2020-09-26-20-26-15_1.jpg;
PHOTO-2020-09-26-20-26-14.jpg; PHOTO-2020-09-26-19-48-03_1.jpg

On Tue, 29 Sep 2020 at 13:03, Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Nicole,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.
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Along Ganges Road x Alexandra
DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

On 26.09.2020 at about 18:55 hours | was travelling along Ganges Road x

Alexandra with no passenger onboard .

While travelling straight , suddenly veh B ( SKV 7011B ) from the opposite direction

make a right turn and collided into my taxi A - Front Right Portion .

As it take place too fast | could not take evasive action to prevent .

| have company video and photo to support my claims .

After the accident , | felt unwell will consult doctor later on .

Weh B { SKV 7011B ) - Mr Comnelius Tay Chin Siak H/P : 8818 8402

Please provide us evidence i.e. video/ scene photo and PIR (if any).

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Jia Le via email.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nicole Chong <nicole@casgarage.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 29 September 2020 12:50 PM
To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SKV 7011B ESTIMATE

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached estimate without your surveyor marking



Regards,

Nicole Chong

Admin and Finance Officer

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.

Addr: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-22
Autobay. Singapore (417883)

Hp: 9791 6119

Office: 6484 2220

UEN: 201828067M

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Regards,

Nicole Chong

Admin and Finance Officer

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.

Addr: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-22
Autobay. Singapore (417883)

Hp: 9791 6119

Office: 6484 2220

UEN: 201828067M



