Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: FONG MOTORS <fongmotors@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 1:55 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SKT9987H

Attachments: DV SKT9987H.pdf

Dear Jaslin,

Attach DV for your reference.
Thank you.

Regards
Siew Cheng
Fong Motors

On Thu, Dec 24, 2020 at 1:09 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for acceptance.
Please duly sign the Release Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: FONG MOTORS <fongmotors@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 12:08 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SKT9987H




Dear Jaslin,

We counter propose for $150 per day
Please consider and sent us Discharge Voucher.

Thank you.

Regsrds
Siew Cheng

Fong Motors

On Wed, Dec 23, 2020 at 5:26 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD 1489S AND SKT 9987H ON 25/09/2020
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) | $5,300.00
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2. Loss of Rental (8 days x $130.00) $ 1,040.00

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $7.45

Total | $6,347.45

Please confirm acceptance.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: FONG MOTORS <fongmotors@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 December 2020 4:02 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SKT9987H

Dear Jaslin,

We reject your offer on LOR can adjust to $160 per day as 1800cc

Thank you.

Regards
Siew Cheng

Fing Motors



On Wed, Dec 23, 2020 at 2:33 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SKT 9987H

LKK Ref: CC6/A1G20010370/Ars3 Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD 1489S AND SKT 9987H ON 25/09/2020

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 5,300.00

2. Loss of Rental (8 days x $100.00) $ 800.00

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $7.45
Total | $6,107.45

Please confirm acceptance.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: FONG MOTORS <fongmotors@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 27 November 2020 11:59 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SKT9987H

Noted with thanks.

On Fri, Nov 27, 2020 at 11:22 AM lJia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Siew Cheng,

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague, Ms Jaslin.
Hi Jaslin,

FYNA.

Thank you.



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: FONG MOTORS [mailto:fongmotors@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 27 November 2020 11:12 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: SKT9987H

Dear Jia Le,

Attach LOD and Invoice for your reference.
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Thank you.

Regards
Siew Cheng

Fong Motors



