Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 25 September, 2020 4:57 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Julie Mangubat; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: OD survey: Claim ref: C10007355/JM || OI-SMF7584A (Black) TP-None || Est: $ || Exs:
$600.00 || Autolution

Attachments: SMF7584A.pdf

Hi Team,

We would like to arrange OD survey for SMF7584A.

Driver - PH
Further excess —n/a
Transport allowance — n/a

We were informed that our PH’s vehicle was towed to Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd. Please call SEAT CENTRE, Mr.
Christopher Dass Tel: +65 98531969 for the details and appointment. For now we just need OD survey as we need
to seek approval from management first regarding technical report.

Please acknowledge. Thank you.

Regards,

Ivy Ratilla
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853
E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg
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This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is
for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: Chistopher Dass Anthonidas <sal@vertex.sg>
Sent: Monday, 21 September 2020 1:35 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: SMF7584A-0D CLAIM

Dear Budgetdirect,

(Motor Claim Department)

Our client would like to claim own damage for his vehicle.
I have attached GIA for your perusal

Kindly arrange for survey

Thank You

Best Regards

Christopher Dass | Tel: +65 98531969

Service Advisor

Vertex Euro Motors Pte Ltd | SEAT Authorised Distributor
SEAT CENTRE SINGAPORE

3 Ubi Road 4 Singapore 408608 | Tel: +65 67429368
www,seat.sg I www.facebook.com/seat.sg

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited,
Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee.
The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect
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views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the
intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure
of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then
delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.



