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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 5:55 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident involving SLZ8359J and SMS1369B on 22.09.2020 (Your Ref: TBA)

Attachments: 15122020175321.pdf

Dear Jaslin, 

 

Please find enclosed the signed Release Voucher, kindly proceed the payment accordingly. 
 

 

Thank You 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

Michelle 

Hp: 9856 4815 

 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 

#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit, 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6341 6789 

Fax: 6341 6778 

 

 

 

 

On Tue, Dec 15, 2020 at 4:50 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

Thank you for acceptance. 

Please duly sign the Release Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action. 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 4:15 PM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Accident involving SLZ8359J and SMS1369B on 22.09.2020 (Your Ref: TBA) 

  

Dear Jaslin, 

  

We refer to your email dated 15/12/2020. 

  

We are agreeable to accept the settlement as follows: 

  

Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $     17,441.00 

Loss of Rental (17 days x $100.00)  $       1,700.00 

LTA Search Fee  $             50.45 

Towing Fee  $             60.00 

Total  $     19,251.45 

  

Kindly proceed the payment / DV accordingly. 

  

  

Thank You 

  

Yours faithfully, 
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Michelle 

Hp: 9856 4815 

  

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 

#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit, 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6341 6789 

Fax: 6341 6778 

  

  

On Tue, Dec 15, 2020 at 3:11 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Your Ref: SLZ 8359J 

LKK Ref: CC4/AIG20010306/Apa3q2                                                    Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMS 1369B AND SLZ 8359J ON 22.09.2020 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement as follows: - 

  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $ 17,441.00  

2. Loss of Rental (17 days x $100.00)   $ 1,700.00  

3. LTA Search Fee  $ 50.45  

4. Towing Fee   $ 60.00   

Total  $ 19,251.45  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 6:00 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Accident involving SLZ8359J and SMS1369B on 22.09.2020 (Your Ref: TBA) 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Please refer to the attached LOD. 

  

  

Thank You 

  

Yours faithfully, 

  

Michelle 

Hp: 9856 4815 

  

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 

#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit, 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6341 6789 
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Fax: 6341 6778 

  

  


