Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 January 2021 3:35 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident involving SDP1948C and SBU1838J on 23.09.2020 (Your Ref: TBA) *** LKK
REF: CC4/AIG20010260/Ada3

Attachments: 05012021143341.pdf

Dear Jaslin,

Please find enclosed the signed Release Voucher.
Kindly proceed payment accordingly.

On Tue, Jan 5, 2021 at 2:12 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for acceptance.

Please duly sign the Release Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 January 2021 1:00 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SDP1948C and SBU1838) on 23.09.2020 (Your Ref: TBA) *** LKK REF:
CC4/A1G20010260/Ada3




Dear Jaslin,

We refer to your email dated 05/01/2021.

We are agreeable to accept the settlement as follows:

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 17,120.00

2. Loss of Rental (13 days x $130.00) $ 1,690.00

3.LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 36.45

4. Towing Fee $ 60.00
Total | $18,906.45

Kindly proceed with DV / payment accordingly.

On Tue, Jan 5, 2021 at 12:15 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBU 1838] AND SDP 1948C ON 23.09.2020
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 17,120.00

2. Loss of Rental (13 days x $130.00) $ 1,690.00

3.LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 36.45

4. Towing Fee $ 60.00
Total | $18,906.45

Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

Best Regards,



Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 10:26 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SDP1948C and SBU1838J on 23.09.2020 (Your Ref: TBA) *** LKK REF:
CC4/A1G20010260/Ada3

Dear Jaslin,

We refer to your email dated 29/12/2020.

For amicable settlement, we would like to counter propose as follows:

Cost of Repair (Included GST) |$ 17,120.00| Agreed with surveyor
Loss of Rental S 2,240.00| 14 daysx $160.00
LTA / GIA Search Fee S 36.45 Agreed
Towing Fee S 60.00 Agreed

Total $ 19,456.45

For Loss of Rental, we would like to request 14 days which included 10 repair days (agreed with surveyor), 2 days of
pre-inspection (23/09/2020 - 24/09/2020) and 2 non-working Sundays (27/09/2020 - 04/10/2020).

Kindly look into this matter and we are looking ahead for your reply soon.

On Tue, Dec 29, 2020 at 9:35 AM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote:
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBU 1838] AND SDP 1948C ON 23.09.2020
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 17,120.00

2. Loss of Rental (13 days x $120.00) $ 1,560.00

3.LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 36.45

4. Towing Fee $ 60.00
Total | $18,776.45

Please confirm acceptance.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 28 December 2020 8:42 AM

To: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SDP1948C and SBU1838J on 23.09.2020 (Your Ref: TBA) *** LKK REF:
CC4/A1G20010260/Ada3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,

We are currently pending approval from our principal, shall revert to you once our principal approved.
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"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 26 December 2020 2:38 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SDP1948C and SBU1838J on 23.09.2020 (Your Ref: TBA) *** LKK REF:
CC4/A1G20010260/Ada3

Dear lJia Le,

We refer to the above matter, LOD emailed on 03/11/2020.

Till date, we have yet to receive any offer from your side.

Please update the status and let us have your reply soon.

On Tue, Nov 3, 2020 at 6:35 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,



Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi Jia Le,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November, 2020 6:00 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Accident involving SDP1948C and SBU1838J on 23.09.2020 (Your Ref: TBA)

Dear Sir / Madam,

Please refer to the attached LOD and Police Investigation Result.
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Thank You.

Yours Sincerely,

Michelle

HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 6341 6778

Thank You.

Yours Sincerely,

Michelle

HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit



Singapore (415875)
Tel : 6341 6789

Fax: 63416778

Thank You.

Yours Sincerely,

Michelle

HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 6341 6778

Thank You.

Yours Sincerely,

Michelle

HP : 9856 4815



8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 6341 6778

Thank You.
Yours Sincerely,

Michelle
HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 6341 6778



