Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020 12:05 PM
To: Darren; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: NCA 8444 FINALIZE

Attachments: NCA8444.pdf

Dear Darren,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed Lump Sum $800 repair limit @ 3 working days.

Kindly submit Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to MS FIRST CAPITAL
INSURANCE LTD

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 25 November 2020 8:34 PM

To: 'Darren' <karzworks.sg@gmail.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: NCA8444 FINALIZE

Hi Darren,
Refer attached, COR 1/s$800, 3 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Darren [mailto:karzworks.sg@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 11:58 AM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: NCA8444 FINALIZE

Hi Taufikh,

FYNA



COR @ Repair limit $800
DOR @ 3 Days

Kindly revise and get back to us on the finalize.

Darren

Karz Works Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-23 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 68442475

Fax: 68442474
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