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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 24 November 2020 2:15 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; Tommy Woon Wui Tew; Jessica Harry Shastri; Ronald Yap
Subject: RE: [Request for LOD & Docs]- You Ref: SKW3099U // DOA: 22/09/2020// LKK Ref: 

CC4/LPC20010179/Upa3(GBD1320A)
Attachments: 0758_001.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
The repairs have been completed for SKW3099U. We submit the following claims with supporting 
documents for your perusal:- 
 

1) Invoice No. 30075518 $10,759.71 
2) Loss of Use (9 days X $80.00) $720.00 
3) LTA/GIA Search Fees $2.00 
4) Letter of Authorization  
5) Discharge Voucher  

Please pay $10,761.71 to Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd,  
$720.00 to Hao YuTao 

          $11,481.71 

 
We look forward to receiving your offer/Discharge Voucher soon.  
 
Best regards, 
Jen 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 20 November 2020 10:45 AM 
To: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [Request for LOD & Docs]- You Ref: SKW3099U // DOA: 22/09/2020// LKK Ref: 
CC4/LPC20010179/Upa3(GBD1320A) 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
For COR, recommended amount at P/P $10,055.80(before GST) with 05 repair days. 
  
Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to 
us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval. 
 
Thanks. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 














