Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 12 November 2020 1:13 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: FBH7895Y REPAIR LIMIT

agree thanks

On Thu, 12 Nov 2020, 1:05 pm Taufikh (LKK Auto), <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Keong,

COR 1/s$1200, 5 days.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 24 September 2020 10:58 AM

To: 'hkllimteam'

Cc: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)'

Subject: FBH7895Y REPAIR LIMIT

Hi Keong,

Please take note repair limit for this bike is $1200.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto



This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




