Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 October 2020 9:37 am

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Cc: Admin A; SUR

Subject: RE: AIG REF: 8537308014SG-003 - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING

OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKV8554U / SGY6775T ON 12/09/2020

Dear Bennie,

Market Value - $ 43,000.00 (Estimated)
LTA - $35,318.00

Nett Value -$ 7,682.00

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 October 2020 1:46 pm

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG REF: 8537308014SG-003 - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE
SKV8554U / SGY6775T ON 12/09/2020

Dear Shirley

Appreciate your prompt reply.
Await for your further updates.
Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #09-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, October 07, 2020 1:43 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG REF: 8537308014SG-003 - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED
VEHICLE SKV8554U / SGY6775T ON 12/09/2020

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Bennie,



We will check & revert.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 October 2020 1:17 pm

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG REF: 8537308014SG-003 - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE
SKV8554U / SGY6775T ON 12/09/2020

Dear Shirley
Further to email below.
Please let us have the following documents (at time of accident) asap for our surveyor review:

1. Market Value of Third Party vehicle
2. LTA parf/rebate of Third Party vehicle
3. Repair Limit of Third Party vehicle

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #09-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Sent: Tuesday, October 06, 2020 4:55 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG REF: 8537308014SG-003 - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE
SKV8554U / SGY6775T ON 12/09/2020

Hi Shirley
Appreciate your prompt assistance.
Cheers!

Best Regards



Bennie Tan

AlIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #09-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 06, 2020 4:51 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG REF: 85373080145G-003 - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED
VEHICLE SKV8554U / SGY6775T ON 12/09/2020

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Bennie,

Report submitted in Merimen.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 October 2020 4:47 pm

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: AIG REF: 85373080145SG-003 - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE
SKV8554U / SGY6775T ON 12/09/2020

Importance: High

Hi LKK Team

Above matter refers.

We have received TP LOD from TP law firm.

Kindly let us have your PRI report & invoice without further delay.
Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd



78 Shenton Way #09-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Notification:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



