Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 February 2021 2:52 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); SUR; (boojohnny@gmail.com)

Cc: Carrine Leong; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing
Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SDM8858Z - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 25 SEP 20

Dear Mr Boo,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm repair cost of $5334.50 @ 3 days.

Kindly forward Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

Their ref: SNM20D203411/C02/THAMYL

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 February 2021 10:06 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: FINAL REVISION - SDM8858Z - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 25 SEP 20

CS/CTI20010138/Avf3
Hi

Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 February, 2021 9:02 AM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@I|kkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@Ikkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang
Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SDM8858Z - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 25 SEP 20




Hi Adrian and all,
Revised estimate and photographs is attached.
Please confirm repair cost of $5334.50 @ 3 days.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



