Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Hup Ley Huat <hup.ley.huat@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 9 October 2020 12:00 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMT685P

Hi Taufiq,

We accept the lumpsum. Thank you

hupleyhuat

On Wed, Oct 7, 2020 at 11:56 AM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Boss,

Attached marked estimate.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto
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