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CLAIM REFERENCE

ACCIDENT DATE

ACCIDENT LOCATION

INSURED

MS FirsteBFital IngureneeLimited -ca.neg. !'lc. 19Sgoa1errC c€T Reg--No. M2-ea!1G6-9 -
6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580

Tel: (65) 6222237L Fax: (65) 52223s47

clairo&irotDrunderuritirq Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore

DISCHARGE RECEIPT

D20003773MFSH

1610912020

STILL ROAD

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD

INSURED DRIVER

INSURED VEHICLE

---\r - lN\/oL\/Fn PAB]Y

OUEK AH BOON

SHD 69375

_sKx_4822L_,

$ 7,300.00SETTLEMENT SUM

l,4Ve. the undernoted CLAIMANT being the person/entity entitled to receive the compensation in relation to the

accident, hereby agree to accept the SETTLEMENT SUM as full and final settlement of all claims for damages, costs &

disbursements arising out of the ACCIDENT, and I/VVE also agree that the said settlement sum:

f . is paid wiihout aOririssiolf bt liabili{fdn the part of MS First Cafitiil lnsurance Limited and/or its

INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER in respect of the said loss and for damage whether

now or hereafter to become manifest,

2. is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said MS First Capital lnsurance Limited and /or its

INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and finally discharged from all claims

whatsoever which IAr4/E now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or

traceable to the said accident.

I61yE acknowledge that this DISCHARGE RECEIPT is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the part of MS

FirsT Capital lnsurahCe Limited and/or its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it shall not bti used as evidence

in any claims or actions which may be made against them or any of them.

CLAIMANT : EVELYNN YAP WEI LING
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Signature and Date : 1

Signature and Date : vlrl;r

f he ci,nl(rills rt thri document apply to vehlcle damages
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, r ,. {.-,i, ih0 ambit and application of this document."
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 21 January 2021 9:51 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving 

SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 16/09/2020.

Dear Asher, 

 
I had spoken to MS Cecilia Lee earlier on. 

 
Kindly send another offer at a global sum of $7,300 (all-in) to her. 

 
Thank you. 
 

Chris Lim 

Motor Claims Dept. 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. 

No. 195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 

 

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 

whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 

error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-

mail. 

 

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 8:26 AM 

To: FCI Claims FCI (cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg) <cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg> 

Cc: Denis Teo Chin Chye <denisteo@sparkcarcare.com> 

Subject: Fw: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

Please review/revise offer for loss of rental. 

 

Thank you.  

 
Best Regards 

 

Cecilia Lee 
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Executive (Accident Repair/Claims) 

T: 6383 7824 | F: 6281 5767  

~ Think Before Printing~ 

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 2:08 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: FCI Claims FCI (cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg) <cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

 

So, are you saying if our client issued writ, your principal will offer as per the rate below? 

 

We'll let our client know. 

 

Thank you.  

 

Best Regards 

 

Cecilia Lee 

Executive (Accident Repair/Claims) 

T: 6383 7824 | F: 6281 5767  

~ Think Before Printing~ 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 2:06 PM 

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links 

or open attachment unless you know the sender.  

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
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Hi Cecilia, 

 

Please take note on the highlight portion. 

 

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Sent: Monday, November 23, 2020 1:32 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 
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Thank you.  

 

Best Regards 

 

Cecilia Lee 

Executive (Accident Repair/Claims) 

T: 6383 7824 | F: 6281 5767  

~ Think Before Printing~ 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 12:23 PM 

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links 

or open attachment unless you know the sender.  

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Hi Cecilia, 
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We refer to the email below. 

 

Enclosed the benchmark for your easy reference. 

 

 
 

Our principal offer to your client's claim is fair and reasonable. 

 

Please advise your client and reconsider and let us have your acceptance. 

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Sent: Monday, November 23, 2020 10:54 AM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 
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Please justify your rate of $107/day when there is rental invoice that supported the rate of $117.70/day 

which is within the NIMA benchmark rate for 1.6cc vehicle. 

 

Thank you.  

 

Best Regards 

 

Cecilia Lee 

Executive (Accident Repair/Claims) 

T: 6383 7824 | F: 6281 5767  

~ Think Before Printing~ 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 10:51 AM 

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links 

or open attachment unless you know the sender.  

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Hi Cecilia, 

 

We refer to the email below. 

 

Our principal maintain the previous offer. 

 

Kindly note that your client vehicle is below 1.6cc therefore the offer to your 

client's claim is fair and reasonable. 
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Please advise your client and reconsider and let us have your acceptance. 

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 5:21 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

Please advise who is the FCI case owner. 

 

Thank you.  

 

Best Regards 

 

Cecilia Lee 

Executive (Accident Repair/Claims) 

T: 6383 7824 | F: 6281 5767  

~ Think Before Printing~ 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 16 November 2020 5:06 PM 

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links 

or open attachment unless you know the sender.  
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‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Hi Cecilia, 

 

We refer to the email below. 

 

Our principal maintain the previous offer, our offer to your client's claim is fair and reasonable. 

 

Please advise your client and reconsider and let us have your acceptance. 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 4:56 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

The rental rate of $117.70/day is supported by rental invoice. Please also include 1 day LOU being the 

downtime for PRI. 

 

Thank you.  

 

Best Regards 

 

Cecilia Lee 

Executive (Accident Repair/Claims) 

T: 6383 7824 | F: 6281 5767  
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~ Think Before Printing~ 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 16 November 2020 4:51 PM 

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20003773MFSH / Your Ref : SKX4822L / Accident involving SHD6937S & SKX4822L on 

16/09/2020.  

  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links 

or open attachment unless you know the sender.  

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Hi Sir,  

  

We refer to the above matter.  

  

Our principal propose settlement as follows: -  

  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $   6,794.50  

2. Loss of Rental (4days x $100)(w/GST)  $      428.00  

TOTAL  $   7,222.50 

  

Kindly let us have your acceptance.  

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok [mailto:cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com]  

Sent: 09 October 2020 12:34 

To: FCI Claims FCI (cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg) <cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg> 

Subject: LOD AGAINST FCI - SKX4822L & SHD6937S DOA 16/09/2020. 
  
  
[External Email Warning: Do not click on any attachment or links/URL in this email unless sender is 

reliable] 

Without Prejudice 
 

Dear Sir/Madam 

Attached our LOD dated 09/10/2020 for your early settlement. Please let us have your reply by email. 
  

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards 
  

Cecilia Lee 

Executive (Accident Repair/Claims) 

T: 6383 7824 | F: 6281 5767  

W:  www.SPARKcarcare.com.sg 

  

 
  

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 

us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 

therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 

Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 

shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 

written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  

 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 

to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  

  

“Please note that this email, including any attachments, is intended solely for the individual (s) or entity (ies) to 

whom they are addressed and may contain information that is private, confidential and privileged. In case you are 

not the intended recipient, request you to notify the sender by reply mail and delete this email, including any copies 

or attachments from your system. Any unauthorized dissemination, disclosure and/or use of the contents of this 

communication to anyone is strictly prohibited and punishable by law. 

  

Opinions, conclusions and statements of intent expressed in this e-mail are of the sender and ICICI Lombard General 

Insurance Company Limited (Company) does not accept liability for the views expressed in this email unless 
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confirmed by an authorized representative of the Company independently of this communication or for the 

consequences of any viruses that may be transmitted with this email.”  
 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 

us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 

therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 

Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 

shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 

written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  

 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 

to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  

 

 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 

us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 

therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 

Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 

shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 

written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  

 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 

to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  

 

 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 

us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 

therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 

Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 

shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 

written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  

 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 

to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  

 

 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 

us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 

therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 

Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 

shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 

written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  
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ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 

to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  

 

 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 

us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 

therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 

Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 

shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 

written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  

 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 

to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  

 


