


theln rnatter of an accident involving motor vehicles

l/we
of

(NRIC No.)

a)

b)

c)

d)

e)

0

hereby authorise to act on myiour
behalf in respect of the above matter.

2. AUrHEury

lAfue hereby authorise you to cemmence legar proceedings in my/our name(sl
and to take instructions from my car-repairers who lnrrE have'appoinied as
my/our agent(s) in respect of mylour claim.

lAffe hereby authorise you to pay to yourselves all Party and Panry costs you may
at any time receive. in connection with the above matter and conflrm that there
will be no need to pay the game into the Client(s)'s Account with your Bankers

lA/Ve hereby further authorise you to release all proceeds of setgernent monies
received by you (after deducting of your lagal costs) to my repairersM/S , __ _ _ _--. _ _ ,_irrsetilementof
my outstanding billiaccount with them.

lA/Ve only wish to he informed of my/our case when it is necessary on your part.
lA//e hereby direct you to keep my car-repairers inforrned of all matters relating to
rny claim, as and when it is necessary to do so.

lA/Ve hereby authorise you to deposit in your Firrns' client's account any cheques
received hy you and made in mylour flrm's narne.

lA//e have read and understood the above.

I,[/
(Signature)

SLT 7464B AND SHC 8828R ALONG CTE BEFORE JALAN BAHAGIA EXIT

ON 12/09/2020

SHAK CHEE HUNG S7383280B
SLT 7464B

GUAN MOTOR WORKS

GUAN MOTOR WORKS
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CLAIM REFERENCE

ACCIDENT DATE

ACQIDENT LOCATION

IN$URED

IN$URED DRIVER

INSURED VEHICLE

INVOLVED PARTY

SETTLEMENT SUM

CLAIMANT; SHAK CHEE HUHG

WTNESs

D200037sSMFsH

1?/08i2A20

CIE BEFORE JALAN BAHAGIA EXIT

COMFORT TRANSPORTAION PTE LTD

NOQRSAIDI BIN $AID

sHc 8828R

SLT 74848

$21,800.00

lA/ve' th. undernqted .LAIMANT b.ing th€ person/ehtity-.fitited to recaive ths compen'ation in reration to the acsideht,heieby asree t'o accopt the sETTLEMeTi suru u='tult ,no nnur *etttemeni c,r ar ctaim* 1or darnages, costs &disburs€menh arising out otthe ncClDrruT, ano IAil= aiso agree that the said setusmentsum;

f is paid without admission of liability on the part of Ms First capital tnauEnca Limited and/or itsINSURED anilor irs INSURED DRTVER ih rgspecr of the Eald loss end for dEmage whetherhow or hereafter to bepome rnanifst,

2' is accopted by mey'us b the intent that the said MS First capital lnBurance Limited and /or it6lNsuRED and/or ls lNsuRED DRIVER be abeotr.rtely and finaily oir"irrgea fiom ell ciaims' whaboever which rrAiE nowor hereafter may have Erising out of or conne(ted with ortraceable to the said accldent

IAA/E aqkno'lvtedge that thE DI$CHARGE RECEIPT ie not to be construed as an admis€,ion of liabinty on the part of M$First Capiht lnsuranoe Limited and/or G INSURED and /or its f NSURED DRIVER anU it sha]l not be usod as e!/id€nceln any clsirns or. qqtions which mHy be rrade agalnst thertr or any of thorn, *7 / ,/,
signatureandDate /,r,,4r/ f -A *-202*l
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 15 February 2021 10:18 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003733MFSH/1 // 

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

Attachments: LKK Adjustment.pdf; LKK Inspection.pdf; LKK Resurvey Photo.pdf; LKK Survey 

Photo.pdf; TP LOD.pdf; LTA REBATE.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Asher, 

 

Please offer as per below: 

 

COR       : $19,800.00 

LOU       : $1,440.00 - $2,000.00 ($80-$100 X 18-20 DAYS) 

LTA         : $0.00 - $7.49    *Require receipt proof. 

Total      : $21,240.00 - $21,807.49 

 

- Please request letter of authorisation from third party before issuing offer. 

 

Thank you 

 

Best Regards 

 

Rachel Wu 

Motor Claim Department 

 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 

 

 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, January 26, 2021 5:28 PM 

To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003733MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 

 

Your ref : D20003733MFSH 

Our ref : CC4/FCI20009987/Kes3q2 

 

Dear Sirs, 
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ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 8828R (OI) AND SLT 7464B (TP) ON 12/09/2020 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the last vehicle. 

 

In accordance to the MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 

 

We seek your approval to offer repairer " GUAN MOTOR WORKS" at $ 21,807.49 (all-in). 

 

The summary is as follows: - 

 

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised   

1. Cost of Repairs $ 40,316.76 $ 19,800.00   

2. Loss of Use (4days x $30) $   2,400.00 $   2,000.00 (20days x $100) 

3. LTA Search Fee $          7.49 $           7.49 

Total $  42,724.25 $ 21,807.49   

 

Surveyor recommended 18days for repair. 

 

Market Value $67,000 

LTA Rebate $46,964 

Nett Value $20,036 

 

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 9:29 AM 

To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003733MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 

 

Hi Rachel, 

 

We refer to the email below. 

 

We are still pending third party LOD to process with the settlement. 

 

Reminder have send to repairer for the LOD. 

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 
 

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, October 22, 2020 9:16 AM 

To: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Eileen Lee 

<EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003733MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT  

  

Dear LKK, 

  

We refer to our email dated 21/09/2020. 

Any updates on this case? 

Kindly expedite. 

  

Thank you 

  

Best Regards 

  

Rachel Wu 

Motor Claim Department 

  
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
  

  
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 



4

  

From: Rachel Wu  

Sent: Monday, September 21, 2020 12:59 PM 

To: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003733MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 

  
Dear Su Li, 

  
Please proceed with express settlement. 

  
Thank you 

  

Best Regards 

  

Rachel Wu 

Motor Claim Department 
  
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 

  

  
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

  

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, September 18, 2020 5:36 PM 
To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003733MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 

  

YOUR REF: D20003733MFSH 

LKK REF: CC4/FCI20009987/Kes3 

  

Dear Sirs / Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We have inspected third party vehicle SLT 7464B at M/s GUAN MOTOR WORKS on a WP basis and TP repairer 

proposed for a EXPRESS SETTLEMENT. 

  

Enclosed for your perusal is:  

- TP estimated cost of repair  

- Preliminary advice 

  

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

  
* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li | Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 1467 Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax : 6271 8802 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Branch : Blk 1007, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-11 | S(159721) 

  

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 18 September 2020 10:14 AM 
To: 'Claim Workflow System'; assignments; Admin A 
Cc: RACHELWU@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG 
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003733MFSH/1 

  

  

  
Dear Sir/Madam, 

  
Thank you for the assignment. 
  

Best Regards, 
Summer Lee | Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 
S(408933) 

  
From: Claim Workflow System <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 18 September, 2020 10:10 AM 
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM 
Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; RACHELWU@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG 
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003733MFSH/1 

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

We refer to the above reference. 

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey. 

Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days. 

 

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal. 

 

Best Regards, 

Admin Team 

Claim Workflow System 

Motor Claims Department 

MS First Capital Insurance Limited 

Tel : 6507 3848 

Fax : 6507 3849 

  

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail. 
 

  


