Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: My Car Consultant <admin@mycar.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 16 September 2020 5:14 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SME5581B Sompo insurance

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Denise,

Please close at the same.

Best Regards,

Huiqin

Claims | My Car Consultant Pte Ltd
+65 88668832

Admin@mycar.sg
Mycar.sg

53 Ubi Ave 1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 01-33, S408934

This Email, including attached files, may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the
individual and/or entity to which it is addressed. If you have received this message in error, please notify the
sender of the error and delete the message. Thank you.

From: "Denise Tay (LKKAuto)" <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 8/25/20 1:58 PM

To: "admin@mycar.sg" <admin@mycar.sg>, SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SME5581B Sompo insurance

Dear Hui Qin,

Our surveyor has re-review and adjust till $7400. Please check

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6271-0351 | email: _sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 17 August 2020 9:38 AM

To: admin@mycar.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SME5581B Sompo insurance

Dear Hui Qin,

please see if able to accept our surveyor offer at lump sum $7050, 5days

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: _sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 14 August 2020 9:33 AM

To: admin@mycar.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SME5581B Sompo insurance

Dear Hui Qin,

As spoken, please see if able to accept our surveyor offer at lump sum $7050, 5days



Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: _sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 July 2020 3:26 PM

To: admin@mycar.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SME5581B

Dear Hui Qin,

Our surveyor has review and offer you at lump sum $7050, 5days

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: _sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: My Car Consultant <admin@mycar.sg>
Sent: Monday, 6 July 2020 4:51 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SME5581B

Dear Sur,

Please see attached survey report as per requested.



Best Regards,

Huiqin

Claims | My Car Consultant Pte Ltd

+65 88668832

Admin@mycar.sg

Mycar.sg

53 Ubi Ave 1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 01-33, S408934

This Email, including attached files, may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the individual and/or
entity to which it is addressed. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender of the error and delete the
message. Thank you.



