Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 18 February, 2022 8:54 AM

To: hysautol122@hotmail.com

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INV SLE 1611L AND SMM 8162R ON 13.09.2020 *** LKK REF:

CC4/LPC20009942/Kea3n2

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Categories: HMK
Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.
For COR, recommended amount at L/S $6,450.00 (before GST) with 09 repair days.

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorization to act, rental
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalization subject to insurer approval

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 February, 2022 5:28 PM

To: hysauto1122 @hotmail.com

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INV SLE 1611L AND SMM 8162R ON 13.09.2020 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC20009942/Kea3n2
Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

For COR, recommended amount at L/S $6,450.00 (before GST) with 09 repair days.

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorization to act, rental
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalization subject to insurer approval.

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



