
To: First Capital Insurance Limited
36 Robinson Road 
#16-01 City House 
Singapore 068877

Attn:   Motor Claims Department 

Date:  23rd November 2020 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

Claimant: Lin Weiliang @ Masarat Louis Lin 
 

 

 

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against you in connection with a road traffic accident on 
13/09/2020 at along Paya Lebar Drop Off Point SLG 2939 A and 
vehicle registration number SHC 1977 P driven by your insured at the material time.  

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your  negligent driving and/or management of your 
ed and our client has been put to loss and expense, 

particulars of which are as follows:  

1) Vehicle Repair Costs     $1,650.00 
2) Loss of Use (SGD$80.00 x 3Days)   $240.00 
3) Purchase of GIA Report     $29.00 

 
Total :       $1,919.00 

A copy each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:  

- GIA Report 
- Purchase of GIA Report Receipts 

 

Please send us an acknowledgement of receipt within 14 days of your receipt of this letter, failing which our client 
will have no alternative but to commence proceedings against you without further notice.  

Yours faithfully,  

Elin Cai 

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd 
130 Bedok Reservoir Road, Eunos Spring 
#08-1339 Singapore 470130 
Mobile: 9450 7920 | E-mail: zoomautowerks@gmail.com 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 17 June 2021 9:08 AM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003750MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV 

SHC1977P AND SLG2939A ON 13/09/2020

Dear Cecilia, 
 
Pls offer as per below: 
 
COR - $1,650.00 
LOU - $150.00 to $180.00 ($50 to $60 x 3 days) 
GIA report - $29.00 
Total - $1,829.00 to $1,859.00 
 
Regards. 
 
Chris Lim 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No.
195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris)  
Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 9:18 am 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003750MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV 
SHC1977P AND SLG2939A ON 13/09/2020 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Please proceed with ES for this matter. 
 
Will reply on mandate offer by next week. 
 
Thank you. 
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Chris Lim 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 
195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer 
to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the 
addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have 
received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 9 June 2021 5:51 pm 
To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20003750MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV 
SHC1977P AND SLG2939A ON 13/09/2020 
 

Lonpac Ref: D20003750MFSH/1 

LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20009941/Uga3q2       

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

We refer to the above matter.  

This is a case of BOLA S26. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $   7,251.50 $ 1,650.00 
2. Loss of Use (3days x $80.00) $      240.00 $    180.00 (3days x $60.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $        29.00 $      29.00 

Total $   7,520.50 $ 1,859.00 

  

**04days recommendation for repair  

  

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 


