Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: S Three Automotive <admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 21 September 2020 4:11 pm

To: SUR

Subject: FW: FBR3033S

Hi

Forward email

Thanks & Regards

p———

Autemotive Recovery Pte Ltd
P-h_] N, ZOT3ES 4 TH

S Three Automotive Recovery Pte Ltd
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-64/66 Singapore — 575643
Tel: 65-6284 1542 / 65-6284 1575
Fax: 65-6487 5315
Email: admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg
FaceBook: https://m.facebook.com/starcarleasingPL

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 17 September 2020 4:09 PM

To: S Three Automotive <admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg>
Subject: Re: FBR3033S

Third Party case survey on without prejudice and this bike left $9500.00 to repair.

From: S Three Automotive <admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 17 September 2020 1:19 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FBR3033S

Hi Kenneth,

Can we check is the motorcycle FBR3033S authorise ?

Thank You
With Best Regards

Michelle

p———

Autemotive Recovery Pte Ltd
Rag No S01325T41R
S Three Automotive Recovery Pte Ltd
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-64/66 Singapore — 575643

Tel: 65-6284 1542 / 65-6284 1575



Fax: 65-6487 5315
Email: admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg
FaceBook: https://m.facebook.com/starcarleasingPL




