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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 February 2021 4:11 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SLG1001L & SHC284L ( ALONG QUEENSWAY 

) Accident date: 4-9-2020 *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20009900/da3

Dear Jaslin, 

 

Please proceed to negotiate from $26,002.99-$26,507.99. 

• Loss of rental - $100-$107 x 11-15 days 

• To get letter of authorisation 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Merina Chia (Ms) 

Motor Claims Department 
 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3856 |  Fax 

No. : 6507 3849 | Email: merinachia@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No. 195000106C 

A Member of  Insurance Group 

 

As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From 

Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails 

and will work to respond in a timely manner.  
We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe. 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you 
may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from 
your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 9 February 2021 5:45 PM 

To: Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SLG1001L & SHC284L ( ALONG QUEENSWAY ) Accident date: 4-9-2020 

*** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20009900/da3 

 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 284L (FCI) AND SLG 1001L (TP) ON 04/09/2020 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We seek your approval to offer repairer “CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PL" at $ 26,507.99 (all-in). 
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The summary is as follows: - 

  
Amount 
Claimed 

Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 29,508.55 $ 24,902.99 ($23,273.82 +7%GST) 

2. Loss of Rental (15days x $107.00) $ 1,605.00 $ 1,605.00 (15days x $107.00) 

Total $ 31,113.55 $ 26,507.99 

 

Surveyor recommended 11 days for repair + 2 Sundays + 2 PRS = 15Days 

 

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 

 

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 18 September 2020 8:47 AM 

To: Go Chee Han <cheehan.go@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) 

<JiaLe@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SLG1001L & SHC284L ( ALONG QUEENSWAY ) Accident date: 4-9-2020 

*** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20009900/da3 

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

SAVE AS TO COST 

 

Dear Chee Han, 

 

You may directly liaise with LKK on direct settlement for this case.  

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Merina Chia (Ms) 

Motor Claims Department 
 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3856 |  Fax 

No. : 6507 3849 | Email: merinachia@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No. 195000106C 

A Member of  Insurance Group 

 

As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From 

Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails 

and will work to respond in a timely manner.  
We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe. 
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Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you 
may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from 
your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From: Go Chee Han <cheehan.go@cyclecarriage.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 17 September 2020 4:00 PM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) 

<JiaLe@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SLG1001L & SHC284L ( ALONG QUEENSWAY ) Accident date: 4-9-2020 

*** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20009900/da3 

 
Dear Jaslin & Ms Merina, 

 

Please advise the direct settlement is handle by FIRST CAPITAL OR LKK. 

( please refer to attached email ) 

 

Thanks  

 

Your Sincerely, 

 

GO CHEE HAN 

Service Advisor - Body Care & Repair 

Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center 

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd  

188 Pandan Loop Service Center  

Mobile: 9181 7717 | DID: 6771 4336 | Fax: 6872 1272 

Website: www.mercedes-benz.com.sg 

 

     

 

 

 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 17 September, 2020 12:46 PM 

To: Go Chee Han 

Cc: Admin A; assignments; Jia Le (LKK Auto) 

Subject: RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SLG1001L & SHC284L ( ALONG QUEENSWAY ) Accident date: 4-9-2020 

*** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20009900/da3 

 

This email was sent from outside of your organisation  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
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Please provide us evidence i.e. video/ scene photo and arrange for TP survey.. 

 

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Jia le via email 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Go Chee Han <cheehan.go@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, September 15, 2020 10:12 AM 

To: Motor_Claims <Motor_Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SLG1001L & SHC284L ( ALONG QUEENSWAY ) Accident date: 4-9-2020 

 

Dear Officer In-Charge, 

 



5

This email is with regards to the above accident which has been reported by our customer. We have since been 

instructed by him/her (motor vehicle number SLG1001L ), to submit a claim on his/her behalf as we are the authorised 

repair workshop for his/her car. 

 

We note that you are the insurer (3rd party) of the (motor vehicle number SHC284L ) involved.  As such we are 

proposing for a Direct Settlement with regards to the repair costs and other consequential losses. 

 

We appreciate your assistance in this matter and look forward to your agreement on this direct settlement. 

 

I can be reached at cheehan.go@cyclecarriage.com.sg 

 

Your Sincerely, 

 

GO CHEE HAN 

Service Advisor - Body Care & Repair 

Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center 

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd 

188 Pandan Loop Service Center 

Mobile: 9181 7717 | DID: 6771 4336 | Fax: 6872 1272 

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity 

named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that 

any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 

email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are 

those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its 

related corporations. 

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity 

named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that 

any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 

email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are 

those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its 

related corporations.  


	2b18ddd80a187e2f4eea0e7271b8d37e0d10f7959ca66d15d5fe626092fd419c.pdf
	ae28eb1ac04c196c442aea6a93c183d74baaea103445b87b1a901884f721f104.pdf
	ae28eb1ac04c196c442aea6a93c183d74baaea103445b87b1a901884f721f104.pdf
	2b18ddd80a187e2f4eea0e7271b8d37e0d10f7959ca66d15d5fe626092fd419c.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style

