Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 September 2020 9:45 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SMK7991G FINALISE

Attachments: WhatsApp Image 2020-09-23 at 11.28.58,jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2020-09-23 at

11.28.58 (3).jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2020-09-23 at 11.28.58 (2).jpeg; WhatsApp
Image 2020-09-23 at 11.28.58 (1).jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2020-09-23 at
11.28.57 jpeg; SMK7991G FINALIZED (ACE).pdf

Price amendment on logo.

From: Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 September 2020 9:38 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Vmg admin <vmg@vermogen-group.com>; Vermogen Ace <ace@vermogen-group.com>; Luis Tan
<luis@vermogen-group.com>; Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com>; Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-
group.com>

Subject: Re: SMK7991G FINALISE

Without Prejudice,
Dear Kenneth,

As spoken, the logo is together with lock so the price amended.
We agreed and accepted the finalized amount @ P/P $800.32 (before GST) & 2 repair pair (excluding
PRS/RS/Weekend & PH).

Attached before paint photos.

Thank you
Best Regards,

Paulo Baldoz

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd

Operation Address:

60 Jalan Lam Huat #03 - 35/36
Carros Centre Singapore 737869
Tel: 6904 4596

Fax No: 6694 4929

On Tue, Sep 22, 2020 at 10:38 AM Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com> wrote:
WiIthout Prejudice,

Dear Kenneth,

We agreed and accepted the finalised amount @ P/P $674.00 (before GST) & 2 repair pair (excluding
PRS/RS/Weekend & PH).

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Minoko

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd
Operation Address:

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36
Carros Centre Singapore 737869
Tel: 6904 4596

Fax: 6694 4929

Mailing Address:
60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36
Carros Centre Singapore 737869

On Mon, Sep 21, 2020 at 4:57 PM Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
Yes.

From: Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com>

Sent: Monday, 21 September 2020 4:56 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com>; Vmg admin <vmg@vermogen-group.com>; Vermogen Ace
<ace@vermogen-group.com>; Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>; Luis Tan
<luis@vermogen-group.com>

Subject: Re: SMK7991G FINALISE

Dear Kenneth,

your amount $674 is under part by parts?

Best Regards,

Minoko

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd
Operation Address:

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36
Carros Centre Singapore 737869
Tel: 6904 4596

Fax: 6694 4929

Mailing Address:
60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36
Carros Centre Singapore 737869

On Mon, Sep 21, 2020 at 4:28 PM Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Minoko, repair cost should be $674.00, 2days.




From: Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com>

Sent: Monday, 21 September 2020 11:47 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com>; Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>; Vmg
admin <vmg@vermogen-group.com>; Vermogen Ace <ace@vermogen-group.com>; Luis Tan <luis@vermogen-

group.com>
Subject: SMK7991G FINALISE

Without Prejudice,
Dear Kenneth,

Please refer to attachments, kindly check & confirm finalize COR @ lumpsum $539.20 (before GST) & 2 repair
days (excluding PRS/RS/WEEKEND/PH).

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Minoko

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd
Operation Address:

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36
Carros Centre Singapore 737869
Tel: 6904 4596

Fax: 6694 4929

Mailing Address:
60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36
Carros Centre Singapore 737869



