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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 20 October 2020 11:06 AM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); SUR
Cc: Andre Chow En De; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos; Loi Ai Ting; Coco Lu Ting
Subject: LOD - Our ref: SMH4372D (KIA) / Your ref: D20003721MFSH - TP FIRST CAPITAL / 

DOA: 13/09/2020
Attachments: scan.pdf

Dear Asher, 
 
Our customer, SMH4372D holds your insured driver, SHC2868P, liable for the accident dated 13/09/2020, and 
would like to claim against your insured driver. 
 
Our customer's claim is for : 
 
Repair Cost : $  7,435.43  
Loss of Rental : $  1,070.00 ($ 100.00 x 10 days) 
Total Claim : $  8,505.43  

 
If you minded to reach an amicable settlement with our customer, please let us have your substantive reply by 
24/11/2020. Otherwise our customer will proceed in a manner that he deems fit.  
 
Best Regards, 
 
JoJo Cheng 
 

 
 

Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4554 •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 

 
 













Hirer Particulars Vehicle Particulars

Name : Tan Swee Kiat C/O Cycle & 
Carriage Kia Pte Ltd

Vehicle No.

Vehicle Type

: SMP284J

: Kia Cerato L
NRIC/FIN/PP/ROC No. : * * * * *932Z Vehicle Model : CERATO 1.6(A) LX
Registered Address : 987A Jurong West Street 

93 #16-553 Singapore
641987

Commencement Date 

End Date
: 06/10/2020 09:00

: 16/10/2020 09:00

Mobile No. : +6596236350

Email address : sweekiat19@gmail.com

Driver Particulars Rental Charge

Name : Tan Swee Kiat C/O Cycle & 
Carriage Kia Pte Ltd

Daily: 10 days x
100.00 Weekly

$ 1000.00
$ 0.00

Driving License No. : * * * * *932Z Monthly $ 0.00
Issue Date : 16/10/2001 Total $ 1070.00

Mobile No. : +6596236350 Inclusive GST 7.0% $ 70.00

Amt Before GST $ 00.00

Deposit Amount $ 0.00

R E M A R K S Insurance Excess

Section I - $1500/ Section II - $500
For drivers below age 22, or below 2 years driving 
experience, additional excess of $3500 applies

RENTAL AG R E E M E N T

The Hirer (as identified below)

No. RRA20090052
Date: 25 Sep 2020

wishes to lease from Cycle & Carriage Leas ing Pte.  Ltd. (UEN:
201900307R), a company incorporated in Singapore with its registered office at 239 Alexandra Road,
Singapore 159930 (“Owner”), and the Owner has agreed to lease to the Hirer, the Vehicle (as identified
below), subject to the terms and conditions set out below and in the attached Terms and Conditions of
Rental.

☑ I wish to receive the latest news and promotions from Jardine Cycle & Carriage Limited. I consent to the 
collection, use and disclosure of my Personal Information by Jardine Cycle & Carriage Limited and its 
subsidiaries and affiliates (“JCCL”), in accordance with Clause 14.2 of the Terms and Conditions of Rental.

The Owner The Hirer

For and on behalf of
Cycle & Carriage Leas ing Pte. Ltd.
Name Name : Tan Swee Kiat C/O Cycle & Carriage Kia Pte 

Ltd
Company Stamp (if applicable) 

Date

Designation  
Date
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Rachel Wu
Sent: Tuesday, 24 November 2020 2:16 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: LOD - Our ref: SMH4372D (KIA) / Your ref: 

D20003721MFSH - TP FIRST CAPITAL / DOA: 13/09/2020
Attachments: LKK ADJUSTMENT.pdf; TP LOD.pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK SURVEY 

PHOTO.pdf; LKK INSPECTION.pdf

Dear Asher, 
 
Please offer as per below: 
 
COR       : $7,435.43 
LOR        : $700-$1070       ($100-$107 X 07-10 Days) 
TOTAL   : $8,135.43 - $8,505.43 
 

- Please request for rental agreement from third party. 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards 
 
Rachel Wu 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, November 23, 2020 5:45 PM 
To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: LOD - Our ref: SMH4372D (KIA) / Your ref: D20003721MFSH - TP FIRST CAPITAL / 
DOA: 13/09/2020 
 
Your ref :D20003721MFSH 
Our ref : CC4/FCI20009870/R1ea3q2 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 2868P (OI) AND SMH 4372D (TP) ON 13/09/2020 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
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The accident occurred when our insured move out from stationary and hit third party vehicle. 
  
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer"CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD "at$ 8,505.43 (all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
  

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised   
1. Cost of Repairs (w/GST) $   8,722.64 $ 7,435.43   
2. Loss of Rental (10days x $100) (w/GST) $   1,070.00 $ 1,070.00 (10days x $100) 

Total $   9,792.64 $ 8,505.43   
  
Surveyor recommended 7days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 

 

Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, November 23, 2020 9:36 AM 
To: Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos 
<lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting 
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: LOD - Our ref: SMH4372D (KIA) / Your ref: D20003721MFSH - TP FIRST CAPITAL / DOA: 13/09/2020  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
  
LKK will revert to you. 
  
Dear Asher, 
  
Below email fyna. 
  
Thank you 
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Best Regards 
  
Rachel Wu 
Motor Claim Department 
  
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
  
  
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
  

From: Jojo Cheng [mailto:jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg]  
Sent: 20 November 2020 11:54 
To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lauro Araos Songcuan JR 
<lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting 
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: LOD - Our ref: SMH4372D (KIA) / Your ref: D20003721MFSH - TP FIRST CAPITAL / DOA: 13/09/2020 
  
  
[External Email Warning: Do not click on any attachment or links/URL in this email unless sender is 
reliable] 

Dear officer In Charge, 
  
Any update of the offer? 
  
Best Regards, 
  
JoJo Cheng 
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4554 •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  

 
  
From: Jojo Cheng  
Sent: 10 November 2020 10:20 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'CWS Motor Claims' 
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos 
<lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting 
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: LOD - Our ref: SMH4372D (KIA) / Your ref: D20003721MFSH - TP FIRST CAPITAL / DOA: 13/09/2020 
  
Hi Asher, 
  
Is there any update from First Capital? 
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Best Regards, 
  
JoJo Cheng 
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4554 •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  

 
  

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 30 October 2020 4:53 PM 
To: Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'CWS Motor Claims' 
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos 
<lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting 
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: LOD - Our ref: SMH4372D (KIA) / Your ref: D20003721MFSH - TP FIRST CAPITAL / DOA: 13/09/2020 
  

This email was sent from outside of your organisation  

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Jo Jo, 

  

We refer to the email below. 

  

We are in the midst of preparing the report to seek approval from our principal. 

  

Shall revert to you once our principal approved. 

  

Please note that all Direct settlement cases with LKK, LOD should be forward to LKK instead of our 

principal. 

  

Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
  

From: Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Sent: Friday, October 30, 2020 9:46 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'CWS Motor Claims' 
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos 
<lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting 
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: LOD - Our ref: SMH4372D (KIA) / Your ref: D20003721MFSH - TP FIRST CAPITAL / DOA: 13/09/2020  
  
Hi Asher, 
  
I should send the LOD directly to First Capital right? 
  
Best Regards, 
  
JoJo Cheng 
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4554 •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  

 
  

From: Jojo Cheng  
Sent: 20 October 2020 11:06 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Songcuan JR Lauro Araos 
<lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting 
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: LOD - Our ref: SMH4372D (KIA) / Your ref: D20003721MFSH - TP FIRST CAPITAL / DOA: 13/09/2020 
  
Dear Asher, 
  
Our customer, SMH4372D holds your insured driver, SHC2868P, liable for the accident dated 13/09/2020, and 
would like to claim against your insured driver. 
  
Our customer's claim is for : 
  
Repair Cost : $  7,435.43   
Loss of Rental : $  1,070.00 ($ 100.00 x 10 days) 
Total Claim : $  8,505.43   

  
If you minded to reach an amicable settlement with our customer, please let us have your substantive reply by 
24/11/2020. Otherwise our customer will proceed in a manner that he deems fit.  
  
Best Regards, 
  



6

JoJo Cheng 
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4554 •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  

 
  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any 
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd 
and/or any of its related corporations.  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is 
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and 
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily 
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.  
“Please note that this email, including any attachments, is intended solely for the individual (s) or entity (ies) to 
whom they are addressed and may contain information that is private, confidential and privileged. In case you are 
not the intended recipient, request you to notify the sender by reply mail and delete this email, including any copies 
or attachments from your system. Any unauthorized dissemination, disclosure and/or use of the contents of this 
communication to anyone is strictly prohibited and punishable by law. 
  
Opinions, conclusions and statements of intent expressed in this e-mail are of the sender and ICICI Lombard General 
Insurance Company Limited (Company) does not accept liability for the views expressed in this email unless 
confirmed by an authorized representative of the Company independently of this communication or for the 
consequences of any viruses that may be transmitted with this email.”  


