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CLAIM REFERENCE

ACCIDENT DATE

,ACCIDENT LOCA.TION

INSURED

INSURED DRIVER

INSURED VEHICLE

INVOLVED PARTY

SETTLEMENT SUM

DaAW374r',MFSH

12t9t2020

A.LONG BLK 106 JALAN RAJAH

CIWCAB PTE LTD

SOON BENG KIM

SHA877OH

SGV1969A

$1,511.00

(

IAA/e, the undemoted CLAIMANT being the person/entity entitled to receive the compensation in relation to the accident,
hereby agree to accept the SETTLEMENT SUM as full and final settlement of all claims for damages, costs &
disbursements arising out of the ACCIDENT, and nruE also agree that the said seftlement sum:

f - is paid without admission of liability on the part of MS First Capital lnsurance Limfted and/or its
INSURED and/or its INSURED DRTVER in respect of the said toss and for damage whether
now or herea*er to become manifesi.

2. is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said MS First Capital lnsurance Limited and /or its
INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and finally discharged from atl claims
whatsoever which IM/E novv or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or
traceable to the said accident.

lAffE acknowledge that this DISCHARGE RECEIPT is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the part of MS
First Capital lnsurance Limited and/or its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it shall not be used as evidence
in any claims or actions which may be made against them or any of them.
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 22 January 2021 12:09 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: MANDATE REQUEST ON QUANTUM - Our Ref: D20003744MFSH       ACC INV 

SHA8770H AND SGV1969A ON 12/09/2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/FCI20009791/Uka3

Dear Khanchna, 
 
You have our mandate to settle as follow: 
 
COR       : $1391.00 
LOU       : $100 - $120 ($50 - $60 x 2days) 
To offer : $1,491 - $1,511 
 
Thank you. 
 
Eric Woo 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Email: 
EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C | TEL: 6507 3848 
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail 
 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, December 30, 2020 9:12 AM 
To: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: MANDATE REQUEST ON QUANTUM - Our Ref: D20003744MFSH ACC INV SHA8770H AND SGV1969A ON 12/09/2020 
*** LKK REF: CC6/FCI20009791/Uka3 
 
YOUR REF: D20003744MFSH 
LKK REF: CC6/FCI20009791/Uka3 

Dear Eric, 

We refer to the above matter.  

We seek your approval to offer third party repairer “FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD” at $1,511.00(all in). 

The summary is as follows: - 

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair (W/GST) $ 3,615.74 $ 1,391.00 

2. Loss of Use ( 2 days x $60 )  $  120.00 $  120.00 (2 x $60) 



2

Total $ 3,735.74 $ 1,511.00 

Surveyor recommended 2 days for repair  

Enclosed herewith all the documents for your perusal. 

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. 

Thank you. 

 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 
From: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, November 9, 2020 6:04 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: D20003744MFSH ACC INV SHA8770H AND SGV1969A ON 12/09/2020 *** LKK REF: 
CC6/FCI20009791/Uka3 
 
Dear Khanchna, 
 
We are agreeable with Express Settlement. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Eric Woo 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Email: 
EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C | TEL: 6507 3848 
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail 
 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, November 5, 2020 5:38 PM 
To: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: D20003744MFSH ACC INV SHA8770H AND SGV1969A ON 12/09/2020 *** LKK REF: 
CC6/FCI20009791/Uka3 
 
Dear Eric, 
 
Liability: 100% 


