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MSOFirstCapital

CLAIM REFERENCE

ACCIDENT DATE

ACCIDENT LOCATION

INSURED

INSURED DRIVER

INSURED VEHICLE

INVOLVED PARTY

SETTLEMENT SUM

MS First Capital Insurance Limited co.Reg. No. 195000106c GST Reg. No. M2-0001675-9

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: [65) 62222377 Fax: [65) 62223547

claims&MotorunderuritinsDept 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (65J 6507 3B4B Fax: [65] 6507 3849
wwvl.msfirstcapital.com.sg

DISCHARGE RECEIPT

iil Thit Dischrrqc Youcher rpplics only to tht claimrut\ claim

fu his oropirtv damagc-ind will not affect his persori'l

iffi*'rtui" ajnd/or uii.osured losset clain iu a latet d;r

Further, the settlemert tenis hcrcin shsuld not be used rs rrrr

.tiOin.i to preMct to dre claimant's personal injrrrics ci';: '

tnd/or other-uninsured losses clnim arisirrg ol 'h;
tibiect matter in this action.

D20003727MFSH

13t0912020

JUNCTION OF EUNOS LINK TOWARDS ECP

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD

TERNG HOCK CHYE

SHD 3448G

SKS 1502G

$8,960.00

lrye, the undernoted CLAIMANT being the person/entity entitled to receive the compensation in relation to the accident,

hereby agree to accept the SETTLEMENT SUM as full and final settlement of all claims for damages, costs &

disbursements arising out of the ACCIDENT, and l/WE also agree that the said settlement sum:

f . is paid without admission o{ liability on the part of MS First Capital lnsurance Limited and/or its

INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER in respect of the said loss and lor damage whether

now or hereafter to become manifest,

2. is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said MS First Capital lnsurance Limited and /or its

INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and finally discharged from all claims

whatsoever which IfllVE now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or

traceable to the said accident.

IANE acknowledge that this DISCHARGE RECEIPT is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the part ot MS

First Capital lnsurance Limited and/or its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it shall not be used as evidence

in any claims or actions which may be made against them or any of them.

CLAIMANT:LIM LEE PHENG Signature and Date

WITNESS

ir{orfzr

6oh Chee &ng Signature and Date









1

Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 26 April 2021 9:24 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [MANDATE GIVEN] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV SHD3448G AND 

SKS1502G ON 13/09/2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/FCI20009787/Uea3 MSFCIL: 

D20003727MFSH

Dear Asher, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

We agree to your recommendation to settle the matter @ $8,960.00 (all in). 

 

Thank you. 

 

Kind Regards, 

 

Vic Sanghilan 

Motor Claim Department 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. 

No. 195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 
 

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 13 April 2021 4:03 pm 

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV SHD3448G AND SKS1502G ON 13/09/2020 

*** LKK REF: CC6/FCI20009787/Uea3 MSFCIL: D20003727MFSH 

 

Hi Vic, 

 

Our surveyor recommended as follow: 

 

Market Value $44,000 

LTA Rebate $33,875 

Nett Value $10,125 
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Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 13 April 2021 3:07 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV SHD3448G AND SKS1502G ON 13/09/2020 

*** LKK REF: CC6/FCI20009787/Uea3 MSFCIL: D20003727MFSH 

 

Dear Asher, 

 

Please advise on the TP vehicle ERV. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Kind Regards, 

 

Vic Sanghilan 

Motor Claim Department 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. 

No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 

 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 12 April 2021 12:34 pm 

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV SHD3448G AND SKS1502G ON 13/09/2020 *** 

LKK REF: CC6/FCI20009787/Uea3 MSFCIL: D20003727MFSH 

 

Your ref : D20003727MFSH 

Our ref : CC6/FCI20009787/Uea3q2 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 3448G (OI) AND SKS 1502G (TP) ON 13/09/2020 
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We refer to the above matter. 

  

The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured lost control and hit both vehicle. 

 

In accordance to the MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 

  

We seek your approval to offer repairer " FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" at $ 8,960.00 (all-in). 

  

The summary is as follows: - 

  

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised   

1. Cost of Repairs (w/GST) $  20,079.51 $ 8,560.00   

2. Loss of Rental (4days x $100) $       400.00 $    400.00 (4days x $100) 

Total $  20,479.51 $ 8,960.00   

  

Surveyor recommended 5days for repair. 

  

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 

  

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 

 

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 30 November 2020 10:46 AM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV SHD3448G AND SKS1502G ON 13/09/2020 *** LKK REF: 

CC6/FCI20009787/Uea3 MSFCIL: D20003727MFSH 

 

Dear Asher, 
 

Please proceed with express settlement. 

 

Thank you 

 

Best Regards 

 

Rachel Wu 

Motor Claim Department 

 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 

|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
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Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, November 26, 2020 4:30 PM 

To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV SHD3448G AND SKS1502G ON 13/09/2020 *** LKK REF: 

CC6/FCI20009787/Uea3 MSFCIL: D20003727MFSH 

 

Hi Rachel, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Liability: 100% 

  

Remark: B:28(j) 3VEH CC OID LOST CONTROL AND HIT BOTH VEH 

  

Kindly let us have your approval on liability. 

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 
 

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, September 21, 2020 11:05 AM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV SHD3448G AND SKS1502G ON 13/09/2020 *** LKK REF: 

CC6/FCI20009787/Uea3 MSFCIL: D20003727MFSH  

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

Attached OI GIA report for your attention. 

Kindly send us your preliminary advice for express settlement approval. 

  

Our ref: D20003727MFSH 

  

Thank you 
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Best Regards 

  

Rachel Wu 

Motor Claim Department 

  
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3862 
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
  

  
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
  

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, September 18, 2020 2:48 PM 

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A 

<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV SHD3448G AND SKS1502G ON 13/09/2020 *** LKK REF: 

CC6/FCI20009787/Uea3  

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Enclosed for your perusal is: 
  
− TP GIA report 

− Accident Scene Photo 

  

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet. 

  

We will get back to you on preliminary advice in due course. 

  

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report and claim ref for our necessary action. 

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051. 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 14 September 2020 12:04 PM 

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: RACHELWU@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT - ACC INV SHD3448G AND SKS1502G ON 13/09/2020 *** LKK REF: 

CC6/FCI20009787/Uea3  

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We have received a new assignment from M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd and TP repairer proposed for express 

settlement.  

  

We will submit TP supporting docs once ready. 

  

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report and claim ref for our necessary action. 

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051. 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

  




