Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 December 2020 12:09 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR GIA REPORT - SMN 9538D ; DOA : 06/09/2020 *** LKK REF:
CC6/EQI20009752/Kba3

Dear Jasper,
As stated below of bank details for your follow up.

Thank you.

Regards
Angela Tan

Motor claims Executive (B&P Dept)

Email: angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg

Phone: +65 9644 3110

60, Jalan Lam Huat #07-43, Carros Centre, Singapore 737869

PR AT A T LT

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 December 2020 12:00 PM

To: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: REQUEST FOR GIA REPORT - SMIN 9538D ; DOA : 06/09/2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/EQI20009752/Kba3
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Angela,

EQ doesn’t require DV to be signed for amount less than 20K.

However , please provide us with your workshop’s bank details as EQ is moving into E-payment modes.

Account Name MUNICH AUTOCARE PTE LTD
Account Number 451-309-965-1

Bank Name UNITED OVERSEAS BANK
Bank & Branch 7375 & 451

Code

Thanks



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 December 2020 11:47 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR GIA REPORT - SMIN 9538D ; DOA : 06/09/2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/EQI20009752/Kba3

Dear Jasper,
We acceptance offer $13,350.00(all-in).
Please forward DV to us.

Thank you.

Regards
Angela Tan

Motor claims Executive (B&P Dept)

Email: angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg

Phone: +65 9644 3110

60, Jalan Lam Huat #07-43, Carros Centre, Singapore 737869

/\N/\NA

PSR AT A T LT

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 December 2020 6:07 PM

To: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: REQUEST FOR GIA REPORT - SMN 9538D ; DOA : 06/09/2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/EQI20009752/Kba3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your email.



