Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020 12:41 pm
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Fwd: AFTER PAINT PHOTO SIM6135T
Hi Shirley,

Can close this case, thank you.

Regards
Taufikh

Get Outlook for Android

From: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020, 11:38

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: AFTER PAINT PHOTO SIM6135T

OK,PLS.CLOSE CASE

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, November 18, 2020 2:02 PM

To: 'Xinya Auto Services' <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>
Cc: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)' <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: AFTER PAINT PHOTO SIM6135T

Hi May,
If ok, we will close this case, please revert, thank you.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) [mailto: Taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 11:43 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); 'Xinya Auto Services'

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: AFTER PAINT PHOTO SIM6135T

Hi May,
Refer attached,revised COR I/s$1300, 3 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 5 November 2020 6:08 PM

To: 'Xinya Auto Services'

Cc: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)'

Subject: RE: AFTER PAINT PHOTO SJM6135T

Hi May,
Refer attached, COR 1/s$1200, 3 days.

Regards
Taufikh



Lkk Auto

From: Xinya Auto Services [mailto:xinyaauto@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Tuesday, 13 October 2020 2:04 PM

To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'

Subject: AFTER PAINT PHOTO SIM6135T

Hi, Taufikh
After paint photo as attach
Thank you

Regards
may

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
, © www.avg.com



