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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 October 2020 1:05 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; mybeautiful closet; bjocund@gmail.com
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKT6949M // LKK Ref:CC4/III20009668/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 

7744Z(III) AND SKT 6949M ON 08/09/2020]

Importance: High

Dear Ms Chew, 
 
Thank-you for your reply. 
 
We have been informed by our customer that they will be selling off 
their vehicle and they will not be pursuing the case further. 
 
You may close this case at your side. 
 
Thank-you. 
 
 
Best Regards 
YM Ho 
TC Autoclinic Pte Ltd 
No 1 Sixth Lok Yang Road 
Singapore 628099 
DID : 67038432 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 28 October, 2020 11:56 AM 
To: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; mybeautiful closet <oops04@gmail.com>; bjocund@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKT6949M // LKK Ref:CC4/III20009668/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7744Z(III) AND SKT 
6949M ON 08/09/2020] 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Mr Ho, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Please be informed that liability is unclear. We are reviewing the matter as based on the video footage, both parties 
were turning into the same lane and resulted the collision. 
 
We will follow up with our principal and get back to you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com>  
Sent: Monday, 26 October 2020 9:41 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; mybeautiful closet <oops04@gmail.com>; bjocund@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKT6949M // LKK Ref:CC4/III20009668/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7744Z(III) AND SKT 
6949M ON 08/09/2020] 
Importance: High 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Please advise if you have any update on the liability 
status for this case urgently. 
 
This case has been pending since September 2020. 
 
We look forward to your advice urgently. 
 
Thank-you. 
 
 
Best Regards 
YM Ho 
TC Autoclinic Pte Ltd 
No 1 Sixth Lok Yang Road 
Singapore 628099 
DID : 67038432 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 23 September, 2020 2:11 PM 
To: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; mybeautiful closet <oops04@gmail.com>; bjocund@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKT6949M // LKK Ref:CC4/III20009668/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7744Z(III) AND SKT 
6949M ON 08/09/2020] 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We are still pending for a copy of our insured video for review. 
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We have sent reminder and will get back to you once we received. Thanks. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 22 September 2020 10:33 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; mybeautiful closet <oops04@gmail.com>; bjocund@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKT6949M // LKK Ref:CC4/III20009668/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7744Z(III) AND SKT 
6949M ON 08/09/2020] 
Importance: High 
 
Dear Ms Chew, 
 
Please advise if you have any update on the liability 
status for this case. 
 
Thank-you. 
 
 
Best Regards 
YM Ho 
TC Autoclinic Pte Ltd 
No 1 Sixth Lok Yang Road 
Singapore 628099 
DID : 67038432 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 15 September, 2020 10:09 AM 
To: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; mybeautiful closet <oops04@gmail.com>; bjocund@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKT6949M // LKK Ref:CC4/III20009668/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7744Z(III) AND SKT 
6949M ON 08/09/2020] 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Mr Ho, 
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Thank you for your email. 
 
We are pending for a copy of our insured video for review. 
 
We will get back to you as soon as possible. 
 
Thanks. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 15 September 2020 7:47 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; mybeautiful closet <oops04@gmail.com>; bjocund@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKT6949M // LKK Ref:CC4/III20009668/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7744Z(III) AND SKT 
6949M ON 08/09/2020] 
Importance: High 
 
Dear Ms Chew, 
 
Further our e-mail message dated 10/09/2020, please advise 
if you have any update on this case. 
 
Thank-you. 
 
 
Best Regards 
YM Ho 
TC Autoclinic Pte Ltd 
No 1 Sixth Lok Yang Road 
Singapore 628099 
DID : 67038432 
 

From: Ho Yue Meng  
Sent: 10 September, 2020 10:53 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; mybeautiful closet <oops04@gmail.com>; bjocund@gmail.com 
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Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKT6949M // LKK Ref:CC4/III20009668/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7744Z(III) AND SKT 
6949M ON 08/09/2020] 
Importance: High 
 
Dear Ms Chew, 
 
Further your e-mail dated 10/09/2020, please refer to 
attached video recording. 
 
Thank-you. 
 
 
Best Regards 
YM Ho 
TC Autoclinic Pte Ltd 
No 1 Sixth Lok Yang Road 
Singapore 628099 
DID : 67038432 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 10 September, 2020 10:14 AM 
To: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Your Ref: SKT6949M // LKK Ref:CC4/III20009668/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7744Z(III) AND SKT 6949M 
ON 08/09/2020] 
 
Your Ref: SKT6949M                                        Without Prejudice 
LKK Ref:CC4/III20009668/pa3 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7744Z(III) AND SKT 6949M ON 08/09/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter.  
  
Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference. 
 
We would like to request for a copy video footage as stated in your client accident report for our necessary action. 
 
Meantime, kindly assist to amend the time of accident in your client SAS report. The time of accident should be 
22:30hrs. Thanks. 
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Appreciate an early reply. 
 
 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 


