Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, October 26, 2020 12:12 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Final Bill for SLG9402K

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Sun Pin

Ok confirm lump sum $5,800.00/7 days

Thanks & Best Regards
S.T.Sim

Manager

Accident Reporting Center
60 Jalan Lam Huat
#04-35/36 Carros Centre
Singapore 737869

H/P: 65-97422188

LION CITY RENTALS PTE

On Mon, Oct 26, 2020 at 11:26 AM Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Mr Sim,

Can adjust to $5,800. Repair day 7 days.
This final amount is very high and add 1 more repair day.
Thank you

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933




