Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 19 October 2020 4:43 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Accident Involving SDH9211) & SJD5848Z ON 25 AUG 2020

Good Day Sir,

Account Name: YEE AUTO PTE LTD
Account Number: 3143076502
Bank Name: UOB

Bank & Branch Code: 7375-007

Thanks & Regards

Ms Phang

Yee Auto Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive

#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com
Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459

On Mon, 19 Oct 2020 at 16:36, Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ms Phang,

Please be informed that EQ is moving into E-payment modes.

Kindly provide us your workshop’s bank details for payment.

Account Name
Account Number
Bank Name

Bank & Branch Code

Thanks



