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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 4 September, 2020 4:35 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: [MSFCIL REF - D20003489MFSH/1] FW: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - 

SJW3138C & SHA3260X ON 31.08.2020

Categories: HMK

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Mei Kwan 

 

Please see below, which is self-explanatory. 

 

We have already established a direct settlement with MS FCI. We will proceed with the repair and bill 

100% direct settlement. 

 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 3 September 2020 10:42 AM 

To: Han Kwan Yong <han.kwan.yong@simedarby.com.sg> 

Subject: Fw: [MSFCIL REF - D20003489MFSH/1] FW: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SJW3138C & SHA3260X 

ON 31.08.2020  

  

 

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 3 September 2020 10:41 AM 

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 

Cc: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: [MSFCIL REF - D20003489MFSH/1] FW: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SJW3138C & SHA3260X ON 

31.08.2020  

  
[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Caroline, 

  

We agree with direct settlement with quantum to be agreed with our surveyor. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Kind Regards, 

  

Vic Sanghilan 



2

Motor Claim Department 

  

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. 

No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 

  

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
  
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 


