


FOO WEN SHIN SDT 8141X



 
 
 
CLAIM NO : 20/20/20/VC05/023616 
DATE  : 08 JANUARY 2021 
     

   DISCHARGE VOUCHER   
 
 
I/We, FOO WEN SHIN confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE 
BHD and/or owner of YM 8518G the sum of Singapore Dollar Twenty Five 
Thousand Two Hundred Thirty-Six and Eighty-Five Cents Only ($25,236.85) in full 
and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property/injury losses 
competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD  in respect of 
all property losses sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, 
arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving SDT 8141X on 01 
September 2020 along BOXPARK 506 CHAI CHEE LANE. 
  
I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE 
BHD/ ZEALOUS MOVER PTE LTD) against all claims and any claims 
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident. 
 
I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to 
PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD.                                                                                                                                                                                                                 
 
I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of 
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our 
insured’s recovery action.  
 
 
 
 
…………………………………….. 
Signature of vehicle owner/Date 
 
 
 
 
…………………………………….. 
Name of vehicle owner /Date 
 
 
 
 

10/02/2021

Foo Wen Shin           10/02/2021
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, 8 January 2021 10:15 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> Accident involving SDT8141X & YM8518G(OI) ON 

01.09.2020 - Oref: 20/20/20/VC05/023616 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Jasper  
 
Please proceed as per your recommendations.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 7 January 2021 9:11 am 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> Accident involving SDT8141X & YM8518G(OI) ON 01.09.2020 - Oref: 
20/20/20/VC05/023616 [External Confidential] 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the subject matter. 
 
It was reported that Insured driver hit parked TP. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD is as follows: 
 

TP CLAIMED REVISED -TO 
OFFER  

Cost of Repair (w/gst) $ 30,146.02  $ 23,734.85  
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Loss of Use ($120.00 x 15 
days ) $ 1,800.00  $ 1,800.00  
GIA $ 2.00  $ 2.00  
Proposed Total  $ 31,948.02  $ 25,536.85  

 
Breakdown of days is as follows: 
 

Recommended repair days  11 
Weekends / Downtime  4 
CLAIM DAYS  15 

 
For your approval and/or further instruction please. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 2 December, 2020 11:22 AM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) 
<jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SDT8141X & YM8518G(OI) ON 01.09.2020 - Oref: 
20/20/20/VC05/023616 [External Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Mei Kwan  
 
We attach herewith the letter from Performance Motors for your action.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 


	SKM_558e20112614460
	SKM_558e20112614460
	Microsoft Word - LPC DV
	SKM_558e20112614460
	SKM_558e20112614460
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style



