11/25/2020 Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: XE817A

AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>
Thu 5/11/2020 10:02 AM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Hi Rasul,
We accepted the offer, please proceed.
Thank you.

Regards,
Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)

Office: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898

W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371

On Thu, Nov 5, 2020 at 9:48 AM Rasul (LKKAuUt0) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

HilJacyne,

Best offer is $ 4000

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth- Print only when necessary-

From: AIM PTE LTD [mailto:automim.claim@gmail.com|
Sent: Wednesday, 4 November, 2020 9:56 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: XE817A

Hi Rasul,

Can pls counter offer Item 1 increase to $4500 and labour charges no.16 $1000?

Regards,
https://outlook.office.com/mail/search/id/AAQkAGNIMTQ10DBhLTcONjYtINGE3OCO5NWVKLTMyZWUwMGFhNWIXNAAQAOF GQ3FVFGNMoQj%2Fix... 1/3
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Rasul@lkkauto.com

Hi Jacyne,

Refer to attachment
Finalised amount is $ 3,750 / 5 days of lump sum repair

Kindly confirm

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy.
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth- Print only when necessary-

automim.claim@gmail.com
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Thank you

Regards,

Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)
Office: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898
W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933

Tel: 91198371

On Tue, Oct 20, 2020 at 3:15 PM AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Rasul,

Please advise the settlement offer for this case

Thank you

Regards,

Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)
Office: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898
W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933

Tel: 91198371
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